
Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X ATRIUM
X Deleted CABLE-RESTRAINED AIR-SUPPORTED STRUCTURE
X CAPACITOR ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEM
X CEILING RADATION DAMPER
X CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY
X COMBUSTIBLE LIQUID
X DANGEROUS
X DEAD LOAD
X Deleted DESIGN DISPLACEMENT
X DIMENSIONS
X DWELLING UNIT, EFFICENCY
X ELECTRIC VEHICLE CHARGING STATION
X  EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE OPENING
X EMITTANCE
X ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEM, ELECTROCHEMICAL
X EXTERIOR WALL ENVELOPE
X F RATING
X FIRE PROTECTIVE CURTAIN ASSEMBLY
X FIRE-RETARDANT-TREATED WOOD
X FLAMMABLE LIQUID
X FOUNDATION PIER
X GLASS MAT GYPSUM PANEL
X GRADE FLOOR EMERGENCY AND RESCUE OPENING
X GYPSUM BOARD
X GYPSUM PANEL PRODUCT
X GYPSUM SHEATHING
X GYPSUM WALLBOARD
X IMPACT PROTECTIVE SYSTEM
X INDIVIDUAL TRUSS MEMBER
X INSULATING SHEATHING
X INTERMODAL SHIPPING CONTAINER
X LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS
X LIVE LOAD, ROOF
X MASS TIMBER
X MECHANICAL-ACCESS ENCLOSED PARKING GARAGE
X NAILABLE SUBSTRATE
X NOCOMBUSTIBLE PROTECTION (FOR MASS TIMBER)
X OTHER STRUCTURES
X PENTHOUSE

CHAPTER 1 ADMINISTRATION
2021 IBC

Not adopted
CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS



X PERIMETER FIRE CONTAINMENT SYSTEM
X PERMANENT INDIVIDUAL TRUSS MEMBER DIAGONAL BRACING (PITMDB)
X PERMANENT INDIVIDUAL TRUSS MEMBER RESTRAINT (PITMR)
X Delete PLASTIC, APPROVED
X PLASTIC GLAZING
X PLAY STRUCTURE
X PORCELAIN TILE
X POSITIVE ROOF DRAINAGE
X PRESERVATIVE-TREATED WOOD
X PRIMARY STRUCTURAL FRAME
X PUZZLE ROOM
X SECONDARY STRUCTURAL MEMBERS
X SHEAR WALL
X SMOKE COMPARTMENT
X SOFT CONTAINED PLAY EQUIPEMENT STRUCTURES
X SPECIAL AMUSEMENT AREA
X SPECIAL EVENT STRUCTURE
X Deleted SPECIAL STRUCTURAL WALL
X SPRAY-APPLIED FOAM PLASTIC
X STEEP SLOPE
X STORAGE RACKS, STEEL
X STORAGE RACKS, STEEL CANTILEVERED
X STRENGTH
X TERMINATED STOPS
X TREATED WOOD
X UNDERPINNING
X VAPOR DIFFUSION PORT
X VAPOR PERMEABLE
X WALL
X WALL, LOAD-BEARING
X WINDBORNE DEBRIS REGION

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 303.1.5
X 304.2
X 304.3
X 304.4
X 305.3
X 306.2
X 306.2.1
X 307.1.1
X 307.3
X 308.2
X 308.3
X 308.4

CHAPTER 3 USE AND OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION



X 309.1
X 309.3
X 310.1
X 310.4.2
X 311.1.2
X 311.2
X 311.2.1
X 311.2.2
X 311.3
X 311.3.1
X 312.1
X 312.2
X 312.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 402.1
X 402.6.3
X 402.7.2
X 402.7.5
X Deleted 403.2.2
X 403.2.2
X 403.2.2.1
X 403.2.2.2
X 403.2.3
X 403.3
X 403.3.2
X 403.3.3
X 403.4.5
X 403.4.8.2
X Deleted 403.5.6
X 404.1
X 404.5
X 404.6
X 404.9
X Deleted 404.9.1
X Deleted 404.9.2
X Deleted 404.9.3
X 404.10
X 404.11
X 406.2.4
X 406.2.7
X 406.4
X 406.5.5
X 406.6.4
X 406.6.4.1

CHAPTER 4 SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON USE AND OCCUPANCY



X 406.6.4.2
X 406.6.4.3
X 406.6.4.3.1
X 406.6.4.4
X 407.2.6
X 407.2.7
X 407.3.1.1
X 407.4.4.3
X 407.6.1
X 411.1
X Deleted 411.2
X 411.2
X 411.3
X Deleted 411.4
X 411.4
X 411.5
X 411.6
X 411.7
X 412.7.3
X 414.1.2.1
X 414.2.3
X TABLE 414.2.5(1)
X 414.2.5.3
X TABLE 414.5.1
X 415.6
X 415.6.1
X 415.6.2
X 415.6.3
X 415.6.5
X TABLE 415.6.5
X TABLE 415.11.1.1.1
X Deleted SECTION 419
X SECTION 419

X X 420.3
X 420.8
X Deleted 420.8.1
X 420.9
X 422.7
X 423.1
X 423.2
X 423.3
X 423.3.1
X 423.3.2
X 423.5.1
X 424.1



X 424.2
X 424.3
X 424.4
X 424.5
X 424.5.1

X X 426.1 Remove "Where required by the fire code official"
X 427.2.2
X 428.3.9

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
503.1.4

X X TABLE 504.3
X X 504.4
X X TABLE 504.4

TABLE 506.2
X X 506.2.1

X 506.2.2
X 506.2.2.1
X Deleted 506.2.3
X Deleted 506.2.4
X Deleted 506.2.4.1
X 506.3.2 
X 506.3.3
X TABLE 506.3.3
X 506.3.3.1
X TABLE 506.3.3.1
X 507.8.1.1.1
X 507.8.1.1.2
X 508.1
X TABLE 508.4
X 508.4.4.1
X 508.5
X TABLE 509.1

X X 509.3
X 509.4.1.1
X 510.2
X 510.3
X 510.5
X 510.8

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X TABLE 601
X Deleted TABLE 602
X 602.4
X 602.4.1

CHAPTER 5 GENERAL BUILDING HEIGHTS AND AREAS

CHAPTER 6 TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION



X 602.4.1.1
X 602.4.1.2
X 602.4.1.2.1
X 602.4.1.3
X 602.4.1.4
X 602.4.1.5
X 602.4.1.6
X 602.4.2
X 602.4.2.1
X 602.4.2.2
X 602.4.2.2.1
X 602.4.2.2.2
X 602.4.2.2.3
X 604.2.2.2.4
X 602.4.2.3
X 602.4.2.4
X 602.4.2.5
X 602.4.2.6
X 602.4.3
X 602.4.3.1
X 602.4.3.2
X 602.4.3.3
X 602.4.3.4
X 602.4.3.5
X 602.4.3.6
X 602.4.4
X 602.4.4.1
X 602.4.4.2
X 602.4.4.3
X 603.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 703.2
X 703.2.1
X 703.2.2
X 703.2.3
X Deleted 703.4
X 703.2.3
X 703.3.1
X Deleted
X 703.6
X 703.7

X X 704.4 Maintain Existing Language
X 704.6.1
X TABLE 705.2

CHAPTER 7 FIRE AND SMOKE PROTECTION FEATURES



X 705.2.3
X 705.5
X TABLE 705.5
X 706.1.1
X 706.6.1
X 707.4
X 707.5
X 708.1
X 708.4.1
X 709.4.1
X 710.5
X 710.5.2.1
X 710.5.3
X 712.1.5.2
X 712.1.7
X 713.12
X 713.12.1
X 713.13
X 713.13.1
X 713.13.3
X 713.13.4
X 714.5.2
X 715.1
X Deleted 715.1.1
X 715.2
X 715.3
X 715.4
X 715.4.1
X 715.5
X 715.6
X 715.7
X 715.8
X TABLE 716.1(2)
X TABLE 716.1(3)
X 716.2.2.1.1
X 716.2.5.4.1
X 716.3.2.1.1.1
X 716.4
X 716.4.1
X 716.4.2
X 716.4.3
X 717.2
X 717.2.3
X 717.3.1
X 717.3.3.1



X 717.4
X 717.4.1
X 717.4.1.1
X 717.4.1.2
X 717.4.2
X 717.5.2
X 717.5.3
X 717.5.3.1
X 717.6.2.1.1
X 717.6.2.1.2
X 718.2.1
X 722.1
X 722.2.2.1.4
X 722.7
X 722.7.1
X Table 722.7.1(1)
X Table 722.7.1(2)
X 722.7.2
X 722.7.2.1
X 722.7.2.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 803.1
X 806.9

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1003.5
X 1006.2.1
X 1006.2.2
X 1006.2.2.2
X 1006.2.2.4
X 1006.3
X 1006.3.1
X 1006.3.2
X 1006.3.4
X TABLE 1006.3.4(1)
X TABLE 1006.3.4(2)
X 1008.2.1
X 1008.3.1
X 1008.3.2
X 1009.2.1
X 1009.6.2
X 1009.6.3
X 1009.8.1
X 1010.1

CHAPTER 8 INTERIOR FINISHES

CHAPTER 10 MEANS OF EGRESS



X 1010.1.1
X 1010.1.1.1
X 1010.1.2
X 1010.1.2.1
X 1010.1.3
X 1010.1.3.2
X 1010.1.4
X 1010.2.1
X 1010.2.4
X 1010.2.8
X Deleted 1010.1.4.4.1
X 1010.2.9
X 1010.2.9.1
X 1010.2.9.2
X 1010.2.12
X 1010.2.13
X 1010.2.13.1
X 1010.2.14
X 1010.3.1
X 1010.3.3
X 1010.3.4
X 1010.5.2
X 1011.5.2
X 1011.6
X 1011.7
X 1011.11
X 1011.15
X 1011.16
X 1013.4
X 1015.2
X 1015.7
X 1015.8
X 1016.2
X TABLE 1017.2
X 1017.3
X 1017.3.2
X 1017.3.2.1
X 1017.3.2.2
X 1017.3.2.3
X 1019.3
X 1020.1
X 1020.5
X 1020.6
X 1023.2
X 1023.5



X 1023.8
X X 1023.9

X 1023.11
X 1024.6
X 1024.8
X 1027.1
X 1028.1
X 1028.2
X 1029.1
X 1030.6.2
X 1030.6.2.3
X 1030.6.3.1
X TABLE 1030.13.2.1
X 1030.16
X 1030.16.1
X 1031.1
X 1031.2
X 1031.3
X 1031.4
X 1031.5
X 1031.5.1
X 1031.5.2
X 1031.5.2.1
X 1031.5.2.2
X 1031.5.3
X 1031.6

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 

CHAPTER 12 INTERIOR ENVIRONMENT
Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 

X 1202.3
X 1206.2
X 1206.3
X 12.07.1
X 1207.2
X 1208.4

X X 1210.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1402.5
X 1403.2
X 1403.14
X TABLE1404.2
X Deleted 1404.3

Not adopted

CHAPTER 11 ACCESSIBILITY

CHAPTER 14 EXTERIOR WALLS



X 1404.3
X 1404.3.1
X TABLE 1404.3(1)
X TABLE 1404.3(2)
X 1404.3.2.1
X 1404.3.2.1.1
X TABLE 1404.3(3)
X TABLE 1404.3.1
X Deleted 1404.3.3
X Deleted 1404.3.4
X 1404.4
X 1404.7
X 1404.10.2
X 1404.14
X 1404.14.1.1
X 1404.14.1.2
X 1404.14.1.3
X 1406.2
X 1406.8
X 1406.1
X 1406.10.2
X Deleted 1406.10.3
X 1406.10.3
X Deleted 1406.11
X Deleted 1406.11.1
X Deleted 1406.11.1.1
X Deleted 1406.11.1.2
X Deleted 1406.11.2
X Deleted 1406.11.2.1
X Deleted 1406.11.2.1.2
X Deleted 1406.11.3
X Deleted 1406.11.3.1
X Deleted 1406.11.3.2
X Deleted 1406.11.3.3
X Deleted 1406.11.3.4
X Deleted1406.11.3.5
X Deleted 1406.11.4
X Deleted 1406.11.4.1
X Deleted 1406.11.4.2
X Deleted 1406.11.4.3
X Deleted 1406.11.4.4
X 1406.12
X 1408.2
X 1408.10.3
X 1408.11.1



X Deleted 1408.11.2
X Deleted 1408.11.2.1
X Deleted 1408.11.2.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1502.1
X 1502.2
X 1503.3
X 1503.3.1
X 1503.3.2
X 1504.1
X TABLE 1504.2
X 1504.3.1.2
X 1504.2.1.3
X 1504.5
X 1504.6
X 1504.6.1
X Deleted 1504.8
X 1504.8
X Deleted TABLE 1504.8
X 1504.9
X TABLE 1504.9
X 1505.8
X 1505.9
X 1505.1
X 1506.1
X 1507.1.1
X 1507.3.1
X 1507.3.6
X 1507.12
X 1507.12.1
X 1507.12.2
X TABLE 1507.12.2
X 1507.12.3
X 1507.13
X 1507.13.1
X 1507.13.2
X 1507.13.3
X 1507.14.2
X 1507.15
X 1507.15.1
X 1507.16.6
X 1507.16.8
X 1507.17.5
X 1507.17.6

CHAPTER 15 ROOF ASSEMBLIES AND ROOFTOP STRUCTURES



X Deleted 1507.18.7
X 1508.1
X 1509.1
X 1509.2
X Table 1509.2
X 1510.4
X 1511.2.2
X 1511.2.4
X Deleted 1510.7
X Deleted 1510.7.1
X Deleted 1510.7.2
X 1511.7
X 1511.8
X 1512.2
X 1512.4
X Deleted 1512.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1602.1
X 1603.1.4
X 1604.3
X TABLE 1604.5
X 1605.1
X 1605.1.1
X Deleted 1605.2
X Deleted 1605.2.1
X Deleted 1605.3
X Deleted 1605.3.1
X Deleted 1605.3.1.1
X Deleted 1605.3.1.2
X 1605.2
X Deleted 1605.3.2.1
X 1606.2
X 1606.3
X 1606.4
X 1606.5
X TABLE 1607.1
X 1607.2
X 1607.7
X 1607.9.1.1
X 1607.9.1.2
X 1607.9.2
X 1607.11.4
X 1607.14.2
X 1607.14.2.1

CHAPTER 16 STRUCTURAL DESIGN



X 1607.14.2.2
X Deleted 1607.14.2.1
X 1607.14.4.4
X 1607.15.2
X 1607.17
X 1607.18
X 1607.19
X 1607.19.1
X 1607.20
X 1607.20.1
X 1607.20.2
X 1607.21
X 1607.22
X 1607.22.1
X 1607.22.2
X 1607.22.3
X Figure 1608.2(1)
X Figure 1608.2(2)
X 1609.3
X 1610.1
X 1610.2
X 1611.1
X 1611.2
X 1612.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 

X X 1703.1.3

An approved agency shall employ experienced personnel educated and certified in 
conducting, supervising and evaluating tests and special inspections for the materials 
being evaluated.

X X 1703.6.2
Copies of necessary test and special inspection records shall be filed with the building 
official, owner, design professional in responsible charge, and material supplier.

X 1704.6 Committee was split with adoption of 21 language and staying with 18
X 1704.6.1 Committee was split with adoption of 21 language and staying with 18
X Deleted 1704.6.2 Committee was split with adoption of 21 language and staying with 18
X Deleted 1704.6.3 Committee was split with adoption of 21 language and staying with 18

X TABLE 1705.3
X 1705.4.1
X 1705.5.3
X TABLE 1705.5.3
X TABLE 1705.6
X TABLE 1705.7
X TABLE 1705.8
X 1705.1
X 1705.12

CHAPTER 17 SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND TESTS



X 1705.12.1
X 1705.12.2
X 1705.13.2
X 1705.13.3
X 1705.13.7
X TABLE 1705.13.7
X 1705.15
X 1705.16
X 1705.18
X 1705.2
X 1709.5
X 1709.5.2
X 1709.5.2.1
X 1709.5.3
X 1709.5.3.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1802.1
X 1803.5.7
X 1804.1
X 1806.1
X 1807.2.4
X 1808.3
X 1808.3.1
X 1808.8.1
X 1809.5.1
X TABLE 1810.3.2.6
X 1810.3.1.1
X 1810.3.3.1
X 1810.3.3.1.9
X 1810.3.4
X 1810.3.5.3.1
X 1810.3.6
X 1810.3.8
X Deleted 1810.3.8
X Deleted 1018.3.8.1
X Deleted 1810.3.8.2
X Deleted 1810.3.8.2.1
X Deleted 1810.3.8.2.2
X Deleted 1810.3.8.2.3
X Deleted 1810.3.8.3
X Deleted 1810.3.8.3.1
X Deleted 1810.3.8.3.2
X Deleted 1810.3.8.3.3
X Deleted 1810.3.8.3.4

CHAPTER 18 SOILS AND FOUNDATIONS



X 1810.3.9.2
X 1810.3.9.4.1
X 1810.3.9.4.2
X 1810.3.11
X 1810.3.11.1
X 1810.3.11.2
X 1810.3.12
X 1810.3.13
X 1810.4.1.2
X 1810.4.1.3
X 1810.4.5
X 1810.4.11

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1901.2
X 1901.3
X 1901.7
X 1901.7.1
X 1901.7.2
X 1902.1
X 1902.1.1
X 1902.1.2
X 1903.1
X 1905.1.1
X 1906.1
X 1908.1
X Deleted 1908.2
X Deleted 1908.3
X Deleted 1908.4
X Deleted 1908.4.1
X Deleted 1908.4.2
X Deleted 1908.4.3
X Deleted 1908.4.4
X Deleted 1908.5
X Deleted 1908.6
X Deleted 1908.7
X Deleted 1908.8
X Deleted 1908.9
X Deleted 1908.9.1
X Deleted 1908.9.2
X Deleted 1908.9.3
X Deleted 1908.10
X Deleted 1908.10.1
X Deleted 1908.10.2
X Deleted 1908.10.3

CHAPTER 19 CONCRETE



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 2103.1
X 2109.2.4.8
X 2109.2.4.8.1
X 2109.2.4.8.2
X 2109.2.4.8.3
X 2109.2.4.8.4
X 2109.2.4.8.5
X 2109.2.4.8.6
X 2109.2.4.8.7
X 2109.2.4.8.8
X 2109.2.4.8.9
X 2109.2.4.8.9.1
X 2109.2.4.8.9.2
X 2109.2.4.8.9.3
X 2109.2.4.8.9.4
X 2109.2.4.8.9.5

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 2205.2.1.1
X 2205.2.1.2
X 2209.1
X 2209.2
X 2209.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 2303.2
X Deleted 2303.2.3
X 2303.2.3
X 2303.4.1.1
X 2303.4.1.2
X Figure 2303.4.1.2(1)
X Figure 2303.4.1.2(2)
X Figure 2303.4.1.2(3)
X Figure 2303.4.1.2(4)
X Figure 2303.4.1.2(5)
X 2303.4.1.2.1
X 2303.4.1.3
X 2303.7
X 2304.9
X 2304.9.2
X 2304.10.1
X TABLE 2304.10.2
X 2304.11.3

CHAPTER 23 WOOD

CHAPTER 22 STEEL

CHAPTER 21 MASONRY



X 2304.11.4
X 2304.12.2
X 2304.12.2.3
X Deleted 2304.12.2.4
X 2304.12.2.4
X 2304.12.2.5
X Table 2306.1
X 2306.1.4
X TABLE 2306.1.4
X TABLE 2306.2(1)
X TABLE 2306.2(2)
X TABLE 2306.3(3)
X 2308.5.6
X 2308.5.9
X 2308.5.10
X TABLE 2308.6.3(1)
X 2308.6.6.2
X TABLE 2308.7.2(7)
X TABLE 2308.7.3.1
X TABLE 2308.7.3.1(1)

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 2401.1
X 2403.3
X 2405.1
X 2405.2
X 2405.3
X 2407.1
X 2407.1.1
X 2407.1.2
X 2407.1.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 2510.6
X 2510.6.1
X 2510.6.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 2602.1
X 2603.1.1
X 2606.7.4
X 2607.3
X 2607.5
X 2610.1
X 2610.1.1

CHAPTER 25 GYPSUM BOARD, GYPSUM PANEL PRODUCTS AND PLASTER

CHAPTER 24 GLASS AND GLAZING

CHAPTER 26 PLASTIC



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 2702.1.2
X 2702.2.3
X 2702.2.4
X 2702.2.12

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X X 2902.1.1
X X 2902.1.2
X X 2902.2
X X 2902.3.3

X X 2902.5

[P] 2902.5 Drinking fountain location. Drinking fountains shall not be required to be 
located in individual tenant spaces provided that public drinking fountains are located 
within a distance of travel of 500 feet (152 m) of the most remote location in the tenant 
space and not more than one story above or below the tenant space. Where the tenant 
space is in a covered or open mall, such distance shall not exceed 300 feet (91 m) and on 
an accessibile route.

X X 2902.7
X X 2903.1
X X 2903.1.1
X X 2903.1.2
X X 2903.1.3
X X 2903.1.4
X X 2903.1.5

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 3005.4
X 3007.1
X 3008.6.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 3101.1
X 3102.3
X 3102.6.1.1
X 3103.1
X 3103.3
X 3104.5.3
X 3111.1.1
X 3112.2
X 3111.3.1
X 3111.3.2
X 3111.3.3
X 3114.1

CHAPTER 27 ELECTRICAL

CHAPTER 29 PLUMBING SYSTEMS

CHAPTER 30 ELEVATORS AND CONVEYING SYSTEMS

CHAPTER 31 SPECIAL CONSTRUCTION



X 3114.2
X 3115.1
X 3115.2
X 3115.3
X 3115.4
X 3115.5
X 3115.6
X 3115.7
X 3115.8
X 3115.8.1
X 3115.8.1.1
X 3115.8.2
X 3115.8.3
X 3115.8.4
X 3115.8.4.1
X 3115.8.4.2
X 3115.8.4.3
X 3115.8.5
X 3115.8.5.1
X 3115.8.5.2
X 3115.8.5.3
X TABLE 3115.8.5.3
X FIGURE 3115.8.5.3(1)
X FIGURE 3115.8.5.3(2)
X FIGURE 3115.8.5.3(3)
X FIGURE 3115.8.5.3(4)

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 3301.2.1
X 3307.2
X 3307.2.1
X 3307.2.2
X 3307.2.3
X 3313.1
X 3313.2
X 3313.3
X 3313.3.1
X 3313.3.2
X 3313.3.3
X 3313.4
X 3313.5
X 3314.1

CHAPTER 33 SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 901.1
X 901.2
X 903.2.4
X 903.2.4.2
X 903.2.4.3
X 903.2.7
X 903.2.7.2
X 903.2.9
X 903.2.9.3
X 903.2.9.4
X 903.2.10
X 903.2.10.2
X 903.2.11.3
X 903.2.11.6
X TABLE 903.2.11.6
X 903.3.1.2
X 903.3.1.2.2
X 903.3.1.2.3
X 903.3.2
X 903.4
X 903.4.1
X 904.12
X 904.14
X 905.3.1
X 905.3.8
X 905.11
X 906.1
X 907.2.2
X 907.2.3
X 907.2.10
X 907.2.13.2
X 907.2.23
X Deleted 907.2.23
X 907.4
X 907.4.2.4
X 907.5
X 907.5.1
X 907.5.1.1
X 907.5.2.1
X 907.5.2.1.2
X 907.5.2.1.3

2021 IBC Fire
CHAPTER 9 FIRE PROTECTION AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS



X 907.5.2.1.3.1
X 907.5.2.1.3.2
X 907.5.2.2.5
X 907.5.2.3
X 907.5.2.3.3
X 907.5.2.3.3.1
X 907.6.4.2
X 907.6.6.1
X 907.6.6.2
X 908.3
X 909.17
X 909.2
X 909.20.6
X 909.20.6.1
X 909.20.6.2
X 909.20.6.3
X 909.20.7
X 910.3.4
X 910.3.5
X 911.1
X 911.1.1
X 911.1.3
X 911.7
X 913.1
X 913.2.2

X X 918.1



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 101.2
X 101.2.1
X 101.3
X 103.1
X 103.3
X 104.2.1
X 105.2
X 106.1
X 106.2.4
X 106.2.5
X 108.1
X 108.2
X 108.3
X 108.4
X 108.5
X 109.3.3
X 109.3.6
X 109.3.10
X 110.1
X 110.2
X 110.4
X 111.1
X 111.2
X 111.3
X 112.1
X 112.2
X 112.4
X 114.2
X 114.3
X 114.4
X 115.1
X 115.3
X 115.4
X 115.5

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY
X CHANGE OF USE
X DANGEROUS
X EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE OPENING
X EXTERIOR WALL COVERING

2021 IEBC
CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS



X EXTERIOR WALL ENVELOPE

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 

X X 301.1

301.1 Applicability.  The repair, alteration, change of occupancy, addition or relocation of 
all existing buildings shall comply with Section 301.2, 301.3 or 301.4. The provisions of 
Sections 302, 304, 305, 306, 307, 308 and 309 shall apply to all alterations, repairs, 
additions, relocation of structures and changes of occupancy regardless of compliance 
method.

X 301.1.1
X 301.3
X Deleted 301.5
X Deleted 302.1
X 302.2.1
X 302.3
X 302.5

X X 303.1
X X 303.2.1
X X 303.2.2

X 306.1
X 306.2
X 306.3
X 306.3.1
X 306.4

X X 306.5

306.5 Change of occupancy.  Existing buildings that undergo a change of group or 
occupancy shall comply with Section 306.7. Exception: Type B dwelling or sleeping units 
required by Section 1108 of the International Building Code are not required to be 
provided in existing buildings and facilities undergoing a change of occupancy in 
conjunction with alterations where the work area is 50 percent or less of the aggregate 
residential (Group R) area of the building.

X 306.6
X 306.7
X 306.7.1
X 306.7.2
X 306.7.3

X X 306.7.4

306.7.4 Type B units. Type B dwelling or sleeping units required by Section 1108 of the 
International Building Code are not required to be provided in existing buildings and 
facilities undergoing alterations where the work area is 50 percent or less of the aggregate 
residential (Group R) area of the building.

X 306.7.6
X 306.7.7
X 306.7.8
X 306.7.9
X 306.7.10
X 306.7.11

CHAPTER 3 PROVISIONS FOR ALL COMPLIANCE METHODS



X 306.7.12
X 306.7.15
X 306.7.16
X 306.7.16.1
X 306.7.16.3
X 306.7.16.4
X 306.7.16.5
X 306.7.16.6
X 306.7.16.7
X 307.1
X 308.1
X 309.1
X 309.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 401.1.1
X 405.2.4
X Deleted 406.1.4
X 406.1.4
X 408.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 501.1
X 501.3
X Deleted 502.6
X Deleted 502.7
X Deleted 502.8
X 502.6

X X 503.1
X 503.4
X 503.12
X Deleted 503.14
X 503.14
X Deleted 503.15
X 503.15
X 503.16
X Deleted 503.16.1
X Deleted 503.16.2
X Deleted 503.16.3
X 503.17
X 503.18
X 505.1
X 505.2
X 505.3
X 505.3.1

CHAPTER 4 REPAIRS

CHAPTER 5 PRESCRIPTIVE COMPLIANCE METHOD



X 505.4
X 506.4
X 506.5.3
X 506.6

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 603.1
X Deleted SECTION 608

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 702.4
X 702.5
X 702.5.1
X 702.6
X 704.1.1
X 704.2
X 704.3
X 705.4
X 706.3.2
X 707.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 801.3
X 802.3

X X 802.4
X 802.4.1
X 803.2.2
X 803.2.3
X 803.2.5
X 803.2.6
X 803.4.1.2
X 803.4.1.3
X Deleted 803.4.3
X Deleted SECTION 804
X 804.3
X 804.4.1.1
X TABLE804.4.1.1(1)
X 804.5.1.2
X 804.5.4
X 804.6.3
X 804.7
X 804.11
X 806.3
X Deleted 809.1
X 808.1

CHAPTER 8 ALTERATIONS—LEVEL 2

CHAPTER 6 CLASSIFICATION OF WORK

CHAPTER 7 ALTERATIONS—LEVEL 1



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 903.4
X 904.1.4
X 904.1.5
X 904.1.6
X 904.1.7
X 905.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1002.1
X 1002.2
X 1002.3
X 1002.4
X 1006.3
X 1007.1
X 1009.1
X 1009.5
X 1011.1
X 1011.2.1
X 1011.4
X 1011.5.1
X 1011.5.6

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1101.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1201.3
X 1203.4
X 1204.9

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1301.1
X 1301.2
X 1301.2.2
X Deleted 1301.2.3.1
X 1301.2.6
X 1301.6.2
X 1301.6.2.2
X TABLE1301.6.3
X 1301.6.3.1
X 1301.6.4
X 1301.6.5.1
X 1301.6.7.1

CHAPTER 11 ADDITIONS

CHAPTER 12 HISTORIC BUILDINGS

CHAPTER 13 PERFORMANCE COMPLIANCE METHODS

CHAPTER 10 CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY

CHAPTER 9 ALTERATIONS—LEVEL 3



X 1301.6.17
X 1301.6.17.1
X TABLE1301.6.20
X 1301.6.20.1
X 1301.6.21
X 1301.6.21.1
X 1301.6.21.1.1
X TABLE1301.6.21.1
X 1301.6.21.2
X TABLE1301.6.21.2
X 1301.6.21.2.1
X 1301.6.21.3
X TABLE1301.6.21.3
X 1301.6.21.3.1
X TABLE1301.7
X 1301.9.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1401.1.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1502.2
X 1502.2.1
X 1502.2.2
X 1502.2.3
X 1509.1
X 1509.2
X 1509.3
X 1509.3.1
X 1509.3.2
X 1509.3.3
X 1509.4
X 1509.5

CHAPTER 15 CONSTRUCTION SAFEGUARDS

CHAPTER 14 RELOCATED OR MOVED BUILDINGS



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X R101.2
X R101.3
X R102.7.1
X R105.2

X X R105.3.1.1
X R106.1

X X R106.1.4
X R106.1.5
X R110.1
X R110.3
X R110.5
X R114.1
X R114.2
X R114.3
X R114.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X Deleted ACCESSIBLE
X APPROVED AGENCY
X BALANCED VENTILATION
X BALANCED VENTILATION SYSTEM
X Deleted BATTERY SYSTEM, STATIONARY
X BUILDING
X CLEANOUT
X CRIPPLE WALL CLEAR HEIGHT
X EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE OPENING
X ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEM (ESS)
X FIRE-RETARDANT-TREATED WOOD
X FUEL CELL POWER SYSTEM, STATIONARY
X GLASS MAT GYPSUM PANEL
X GRADE FLOOR EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE OPENING
X GYPSUM SHEATHING
X GYPSUM WALLBOARD
X HIGH-EFFICACY LIGHT SOURCES
X HOT WATER
X INSULATING SHEATHING
X INTERMODAL SHIPPING CONTAINER
X LIVE/WORK UNIT
X LOT
X LOT LINE
X NONCOMBUSTIBLE MATERIAL

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS

2021 IRC (No Mechanical, Plumbing, Energy, Fuel Gas)
CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION



X PRESS-CONNECT JOINT
X PUSH-FIT FITTING
X Deleted READILY ACCESSIBLE
X ROOF ASSEMBLY
X SLEEPING UNIT
X STAIRWAY
X STORM SHELTER
X TOWNHOUSE
X TOWNHOUSE, UNIT
X VAPOR DIFFUSION PORT
X VAPOR PERMEABLE
X WINDBORNE DEBRIS REGION

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 

X X R301.1.4

R301.1.4 Intermodal shipping containers. Intermodal shipping containers that are 
repurposed for use as buildings or structures shall be designed in accordance with the 
structural provisions in Section 3115 of the International Building Code.  Prior to 
permitting, the applicant shall have the unit certified as free from contaminants by a 
qualified 3rd party inspector approved by the AHJ.  Any penetrations beyond those 
permitted in Section 3115 of the International Building Code shall be certified by a 
Pennsylvania  Registered Design Professional. 

X TABLE R301.2
X TABLE R301.2.1(1)
X TABLE R301.2.1(2)
X FIGURE R301.2.2.1(1)
X FIGURE R301.2.2.1(2)
X FIGURE R301.2.2.1(3)
X FIGURE R301.2.2.1(4)
X FIGURE R301.2.2.1(5)
X FIGURE R301.2.2.1(6)
X FIGURE R301.2.2.1.1(1)
X FIGURE R301.2.2.1.1(2)
X FIGURE R301.2.2.1.1(3)
X FIGURE R301.2.2.1.1(4)
X FIGURE R301.2.2.1.1(5)
X FIGURE R301.2.2.1.1(6)
X R301.2.1
X R301.2.1.1
X FIGURE R301.2(4)
X TABLE R301.2.1.5.1
X R301.2.2.1
X R301.2.2.1.1
X R301.2.2.1.2
X R301.2.2.6

CHAPTER 3 BUILDING PLANNING



X R301.2.2.7
X R301.2.2.10
X R301.3
X TABLE R301.5
X R301.6
X TABLE R301.7
X R302.2
X R302.2.1
X R302.2.2
X R302.2.3
X R302.2.4
X R302.2.6
X R302.3
X R302.4.1
X R302.4.2

X R302.5.1 Committee is split with adoption of new language and staying with current language
X R302.8.1
X R302.9.5
X R303.1
X R303.4

X X R305.1

4. Beams and girders spaced apart a minimum of 36 inches (914 mm) in clear finished 
width between projections, and shall have a minimum clear ceiling height of  6 feet 6  
inches (1981 mm) from the finished floor directly under the beam.

X R308.4.5
X R308.6.3
X R308.6.4
X R308.6.5
X R308.6.7
X R309.3

X X R310.1

4. Properties with in-fill lots that are sprinklered in accordance with Section 2904, and a 
minimum clear yard size of 80 sq ft shall, be allowed to have access to the public way 
provided by a shared easement that is a minimum of 30 in wide. 

X X R310.1.1
X R310.2
X R310.2.1
X R310.2.2
X R310.2.3
X R310.2.4
X R310.3
X Deleted R310.3.1
X Deleted R310.3.2
X Deleted R310.3.2.1



X Deleted R310.3.2.2
X R310.4
X R310.4.1
X R310.4.2
X R310.4.2.1
X R310.4.2.2
X R310.4.3
X R310.4.4
X R310.5
X R310.6
X R310.7

X X R310.7.1
X R311.7
X R311.7.3
X R311.7.5.1
X R311.7.7
X R311.7.8.4
X R311.8
X R312.1.1
X R312.2.1
X R312.2.2
X R314.3

X X R314.3.1
X R315.2.2
X R316.3
X R316.3.1
X R316.3.2
X R316.5.13
X R317.1
X Deleted R317.1.3
X Deleted R317.1.4
X Deleted R317.1.53
X R320.1
X Deleted R320.1.1
X R320.2

X X R322.1.6
X X R322.2

X R322.2.1 Committee is split with adoption of new language and staying with current language
X X R322.2.2
X X R322.2.2.1
X X R322.2.3

X R322.3.2 Committee is split with adoption of new language and staying with current language
X X R322.3.3



X X R322.3.5
X X R322.3.6
X X R322.3.7

X R323.1
X R323.1.1
X R324.3
X R324.3.1
X R324.5
X R324.5.3
X R324.6
X R324.6.3
X R325.1
X R325.3
X Deleted R325.6

X X R326.1
X X R326.2
X X R326.3 Remove exceptions 3 and 4
X X R326.4

X R328.1
X R328.2
X R328.3
X R328.3.1
X R328.4
X R328.5
X R328.6
X R328.7
X R328.8
X R328.9
X R328.10
X R328.11
X R329.1
X R329.2
X R330.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X TABLE R403.1(1)
X TABLE R403.1(2)
X TABLE R403.1(3)
X R403.1.1
X R403.1.4
X R403.1.4.1
X R403.1.6
X TABLE R404.1.1(1)
X TABLE R404.1.1(2)
X TABLE R404.1.1(3)

CHAPTER 4 FOUNDATIONS



X TABLE R404.1.1(4)
X TABLE R404.1.2(1)
X TABLE R404.1.2(8)
X R404.1.2.1
X R404.1.3.3.6
X R404.1.3.3.7.1
X R406.2
X R408.1
X R408.2
X R408.3
X R408.8

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X R502.3.2
X TABLE R502.3.3(1)
X TABLE R502.3.3(2)
X R505.1.1.1
X R505.1.2
X Deleted FIGURE R505.1.2
X R505.1.3
X R505.2.1
X R505.2.2
X R505.2.3
X Deleted TABLE R505.2.3
X Deleted FIGURE R505.2.3(1)
X Deleted FIGURE R505.2.3(2)
X R505.2.4
X R505.2.6
X Deleted R505.2.6.1
X Deleted FIGURE R505.2.6.1
X Deleted R505.2.6.2
X Deleted FIGURE R505.2.6.3

X X R506.2.3

R506.2.3 Vapor retarder.  A minimum 6 mil (0.006 inch: 152 μm) polyethylene or 
approved with joints lapped not less than 6 inches (152 mm) shall be placed between 
the concrete floor slab and the base course or the prepared subgrade where a base 
course does not exist.  Exception: The vapor retarder is not required for the following:  
1. Garages, utility buildings and other unheated accessory structures.  2. For unheated 
storage rooms having an area of less than 70 square feet (6.5 m2) and carports.  3. 
Driveways, walks, patios and other flatwork not likely to be enclosed and heated at a 
later date.  4.  Where approved  by the building official , based on local site conditions. 

X R507.1
X TABLE R507.2.3
X R507.3

CHAPTER 5 FLOORS



X TABLE R507.3.1
X R507.3.2
X R507.3.3
X R507.4
X Deleted TABLE R507.4
X TABLE 507.4
X R507.5
X TABLE R507.5(1)
X TABLE R507.5(2)
X TABLE R507.5(3)
X TABLE R507.5(4)
X TABLE R507.5(5)
X R507.6
X Deleted TABLE R507.6
X TABLE R507.6
X R507.7
X TABLE R507.7
X R507.9.1.2
X Deleted TABLE R507.9.1.3(1)
X TABLE R507.9.1.3(1)
X R507.10
X R507.10.1
X R507.10.1.1
X R507.10.1.2
X R507.10.2
X R507.10.3
X R507.10.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X TABLE R602.3(1)
X TABLE R602.3(2)
X R602.3.1
X R602.6
X R602.7.5
X R602.9
X R602.10.1.2
X TABLE R602.10.1.3
X R602.10.2.2
X R602.10.2.2.1
X TABLE R602.10.3(1)
X TABLE R602.10.3(2)
X TABLE R602.10.3(3)
X TABLE R602.10.3(4)
X TABLE R602.10.4
X FIGURE R602.10.6.2

CHAPTER 6 WALL CONSTRUCTION



X R602.10.6.4
X TABLE R602.10.6.4
X R602.10.6.5
X R602.10.6.5.1
X R602.10.6.5.2
X FIGURE R602.10.6.5
X R602.10.6.5.3
X R602.10.6.5.4
X TABLER602.10.6.5
X R602.10.10.1
X R602.12.6.2
X R603.1.1.1
X R603.1.2
X Deleted FIGURE R603.1.2
X R603.2.1
X R603.2.2
X R603.2.3
X Deleted TABLE R603.2.3
X Deleted FIGURE R603.2.3(1)
X Deleted FIGURE R603.2.3(2)
X R603.2.4 
X R603.2.6
X Deleted R603.2.6.1
X Deleted FIGURE R603.2.6.1
X Deleted R603.2.6.2
X Deleted R603.2.6.3
X Deleted FIGURE R603.2.6.3
X R603.3.2
X R608.1
X R608.5.1
X R609.1
X R609.4

X X R609.4.1
X TABLE R610.5(2)
X TABLE 610.8

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X X TABLE R702.3.5

X R702.7
X TABLE R702.7(1)
X TABLE R702.7(2)
X TABLE R702.7(3)
X TABLE R702.7(4)
X Deleted R702.7.1
X Deleted R702.7.2

CHAPTER 7 WALL COVERING



X Deleted R702.7.3
X R702.7.1

X X R703.2

R703.2 Water-resistive barrier. Not fewer than one layer of water-resistive barrier shall 
be applied over studs or sheathing of all exterior walls with flashing as indicated in Section 
R703.4, in such a manner as to provide a continuous water-resistive barrier behind the 
exterior wall veneer. The water-resistive barrier material shall be continuous to the top of 
walls and terminated at penetrations and building appendages in a manner to meet the 
requirements of the exterior wall envelope as described in Section R703.1.   Where the 
water-resistive barrier also functions as a component of a continuous air barrier, the 
water-resistive barrier shall be installed as an air barrier in accordance with Section 
N1102.4.1.1.  Water-resistive barrier materials shall comply with one of the following: 1. 
No. 15 felt  complying with ASTM D226, Type 1.  2. ASTM E2568, Type 1 or 2.  3. Foam 
plastic insulating sheathing water-resistive barrier systems complying with Section 
R703.1.1 and installed in accordance with the manufacturer's installation instructions.  4. 
ASTM E331 in accordance with Section R703.1.1.  5. Other approved materials in 
accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions.
No.15 asphalt felt and water-resistive barriers complying with ASTM E2556 shall be 
applied horizontally, with the upper layer lapped over the lower layer not less than 2 
inches (51 mm), and where joints occur, shall be lapped not less than 6 inches (152 mm).  
Exception: A water-resistive barrier shall not be required in unconditioned detached tool 
sheds, playhouses, and other similar accessory structures provided all of the following 
requirements are met: 1. Exterior wall covering is limited to siding that is attached directly 
to the studs.  2. Exterior walls are uninsulated.  3. Interior side of exterior walls has no wall 
covering or wall finishes.

X X R703.3.1 R703.3.1 Exterior soffit installation. Exterior soffits shall comply with Section R704.
X Deleted R703.3.1.1
X Deleted R703.3.1.2
X TABLE R703.3.2
X R703.4



X X R703.4.1

R703.4.1 Flashing installation at exterior window and door openings. Flashing at 
exterior window and door
openings shall extend to the surface of the exterior wall finish or to a water-resistive 
barrier complying with Section 703.2 for subsequent drainage. Air sealing shall be 
installed around all window and door openings on the
interior side of the rough opening gap. Mechanically attached flexible flashings shall 
comply with AAMA 712. Flashing at exterior window and door openings shall be installed 
in accordance with one or more of the following:  1. The fenestration manufacturer’s 
installation and flashing instructions, or for applications not addressed in the fenestration 
manufacturer’s instructions, in accordance with the flashing or water-resistive barrier 
manufacturer’s instructions. Where flashing instructions or details are not provided, pan 
flashing shall be installed at the sill of exterior window and door openings. Pan flashing 
shall be sealed or sloped in such a manner as to direct water to the surface of the exterior 
wall finish or to the water resistive barrier for subsequent drainage. Openings using pan 
flashing shall incorporate flashing or protection at the head and sides.  2. In accordance 
with the flashing design or method of a registered design professional.  3. In accordance 
with other approved methods. 

X TABLE R703.6.3(1)
X TABLE R703.6.3(2)
X R703.7.1
X R703.7.1.1
X R703.7.3
X R703.7.3.1
X R703.7.3.2
X R703.8.4
X TABLE R703.8.4(1)
X R703.11.2
X TABLE R703.11.2
X TABLE R703.15.1
X TABLE R703.15.2
X TABLE R703.16.1
X TABLE R703.16.2

X X R704.1

R704.1 General wind limitations. Where the design wind pressure is 30 pounds per 
square foot (1.44 kPa) or less, exterior soffits shall comply with Section R704.2. Where 
the design wind pressure exceeds 30 pounds per square foot (1.44 kPa), exterior soffits 
shall comply with Section R704.3. The design wind pressure on exterior soffits shall be 
determined using the component and cladding loads specified in Table R301.2.1(1) for 
walls using an effective wind area of 10 square feet (0.93 m2) and adjusted for height and 
exposure in accordance with Table R301.2.1(2).



X X R704.2

R704.2 Exterior soffit installation where the design wind pressure is 30 psf or less. 
Where the design wind pressure is 30 pounds per square foot (1.44 kPa) or less, exterior 
soffit installation shall comply with Section R704.2.1, R704.2.2, R704.2.3 or R704.2.4.  
Soffit materials not addressed in Sections R704.2.1 through R704.2.4 shall be in 
accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions.

X X R704.2.1

R704.2.1 Vinyl and aluminum soffit panels. Vinyl and aluminum soffit panels shall be 
installed using aluminum, galvanized, stainless steel or rust-preventative coated nails or 
staples or other approved corrosion-resistant fasteners specified by the manufacturer 
and shall be fastened at both ends to a supporting component such as a nailing strip, 
fascia or subfascia component in accordance with Figure R704.2.1(1). Where the 
unsupported span of soffit panels is greater than 16 inches (406 mm), intermediate 
nailing strips shall be provided in accordance with Figure R704.2.1(2). Vinyl and 
aluminum soffit panels shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s 
installation instructions. Fascia covers shall be installed in accordance with the 
manufacturer’s installation instructions.

X X FIGURE R704.2.1(1)



X X FIGURE R704.2.1(2)

X X R704.2.2

R704.2.2 Fiber-cement exterior soffit panels. Fiber-cement exterior soffit panels shall be 
a minimum of 1/4 inch (6.4 mm) in thickness and shall comply with the requirements of 
ASTM C1186, Type A, minimum Grade II, or ISO 8336, Category A, minimum Class 2. 
Panel joints shall occur over framing or over wood structural panel sheathing. Exterior 
soffit panels shall be installed with spans and fasteners in accordance with the 
manufacturer’s installation instructions.

X X R704.2.3

R704.2.3 Hardboard exterior soffit panels. Hardboard exterior soffit panels shall be not 
less than 7/16 inch (11.11 mm) in thickness and shall be fastened to framing or nailing 
strips with 2-1/2-inch by 0.113-inch (64 mm by 2.9 mm) siding nails spaced not more than 
6 inches (152 mm) on center at panel edges and 12 inches (305 mm) on center at 
intermediate supports.

X X R704.2.4

R704.2.4 Wood structural panel exterior soffit. The minimum nominal thickness for 
wood structural panel soffits shall be 3/8 inch (9.5 mm) and shall be fastened to framing 
or nailing strips with 2-inch by 0.099-inch (51 mm by 2.5 mm) nails. Fasteners shall be 
spaced not more than 6 inches (152 mm) on center at panel edges and 12 inches (305 
mm) on center at intermediate supports.

X X R704.3

R704.3 Exterior soffit installation where the design wind pressure exceeds 30 psf. 
Where the design wind pressure is greater than 30 psf, exterior soffit installation shall 
comply with Section R704.3.1, R704.3.2, R704.3.3 or R704.3.4. Exterior soffit materials 
not addressed in Sections R704.3.1 through R704.3.4 shall be in accordance with the 
manufacturer’s installation instructions.



X X R704.3.1

R704.3.1 Vinyl exterior soffit panels. Vinyl exterior soffit panels and their attachments 
shall be capable of resisting wind loads specified in Table R301.2.1(1) for walls using an 
effective wind area of 10 square feet (0.929 m2) and adjusted for height and exposure in 
accordance with Table R301.2.1(2). Vinyl exterior soffit panels shall be installed using 
fasteners specified by the manufacturer and shall be fastened at both ends to a 
supporting component such as a nailing strip, fascia or subfascia component in 
accordance with Figure R704.2.1(1). Where the unsupported span of exterior soffit panels 
is greater than 12 inches (305 mm), intermediate nailing strips shall be provided in 
accordance with Figure R704.2.1(2). Vinyl exterior soffit panels shall be installed in 
accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions.

X X R704.3.2

R704.3.2 Fiber-cement exterior soffit panels. Fiber-cement exterior soffit panels shall 
comply with Section R704.2.2 and shall be capable of resisting wind loads specified in 
Table R301.2.1(1) for walls using an effective wind area of 10 square feet (0.929 m2) and 
adjusted for height and exposure in accordance with Table R301.2.1(2).

X X R704.3.3

R704.3.3 Hardboard exterior soffit panels. Hardboard exterior soffit panels shall comply 
with the manufacturer’s installation instructions and shall be capable of resisting wind 
loads specified in Table R301.2.1(1) for walls using an effective wind area of 10 square 
feet (0.929 m2) and adjusted for height and exposure in accordance with Table 
R301.2.1(2).

X X R704.3.4

R704.3.4 Wood structural panel exterior soffit. Wood structural panel exterior soffits 
shall be capable of resisting wind loads specified in Table R301.2.1(1) for walls using an 
effective wind area of 10 square feet (0.929 m2) and adjusted for height and exposure in 
accordance with Table R301.2.1(2). Alternatively, wood structural panel exterior soffits 
shall be installed in accordance with Table R704.3.4.

X X TABLE R704.3.4

e. Wood structural panels shall be attached to soffit framing members with specific 
gravity of at least 0.35. Where the specific gravity of the wood species used for sofit 
framing members is greater than or equal to 0.35 but less than 0.42 in accordance with 
AWC NDS, the fastener spacing shall be multiplied by 0.67 or the same fastener spacing 
as prescribed for galvanized steel nails shall be permitted to be used where RSRS-01 (2" x 
0.099" x 0.266" head) nails replace 6d box nails and RSRS-03 (2-1/2" x 0.131" x 0.281" 
head) nails replace 8d common nails or 10d box nails. RSRS is a Roof Sheathing Ring 
Shank nail meeting the specifications in ASTM F1667. Framing members shall be 
minimum 2 × 3 nominal with the larger dimension in the cross section aligning with the 
length of fasteners to provide sufficient embedment depths.

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X R802.1.5
X R802.1.5.2
X R802.1.5.3
X R802.1.5.3.1

CHAPTER 8 ROOF-CEILING CONSTRUCTION



X X R802.3

R802.3 Ridge. A ridge board used to connect opposing rafters shall be not less than 1 inch 
(25 mm) nominal thickness and not less in depth than the cut end of the rafter. Where 
ceiling joist or rafter ties do not provide continuous ties across the structure as required 
by Section R802.5.2, the ridge shall be supported by a wall or ridge beam designed in 
accordance with accepted engineering practice and supported on each end by a wall, or 
column, or girder.

X R802.4.2
X R802.4.6
X R802.5
X R802.5.2
X Deleted TABLE R802.5.2
X TABLE R802.5.2
X R802.5.2.1
X TABLE R802.5.2(1)
X R802.5.2.2
X R802.6
X R802.10.2
X R802.11
X R804.1.1.1
X R804.1.2
X Figure R804.1.2
X R804.2.1
X R804.2.2
X R804.2.3
X Deleted TABLE R804.2.3
X Deleted FIGURE R804.2.3(1)
X Deleted FIGURE R804.2.3(2)
X R804.2.4
X R804.2.6
X Deleted R804.2.6.1
X Deleted FIGURE R804.2.6.1
X Deleted R804.2.6.2
X Deleted R804.2.6.3
X Deleted FIGURE R804.2.6.3
X TABLE R804.3
X TABLE R804.3.2.1(2)
X R804.3.2.1.2
X FIGURE R804.3.2.1.2
X R804.3.2.5
X R804.3.6
X R805.1
X R806.5

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
CHAPTER 9 ROOF ASSEMBLIES



X R902.3
X R902.4
X R905.1.1
X TABLE R905.1.1(1)
X TABLE R905.1.1(2)
X TABLE R905.1.1(3)
X R905.3.1
X R905.3.6
X R905.4.4.1
X TABLE R905.4.4.1
X TABLE R905.7.5(2)
X R905.16.4
X R905.16.6
X TABLE R905.16.6
X R905.17.5
X Deleted R905.17.7
X R906.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X R1001.13

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X E3404.4
X E3404.11
X E3405.2
X E3405.7
X E3406.2
X E3406.3
X E3406.4
X E3406.6
X E3406.12
X E3407.3
X E3407.4.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X ACCESSIBLE
X BATHROOM
X BONDING JUMPER
X GROUND-FAULT CIRCUIT INTERRUPTER
X GROUND-FAULT CIRCUIT PATH
X GROUNDING CONDUCTOR EQUIPMENT (EGC)
X HABITABLE ROOM
X LAUNDRY AREA
X RECEPTACLE
X RECONDITIONED

CHAPTER 35 ELECTRICAL DEFINITIONS

CHAPTER 34 GENERAL REQUIREMENTS

CHAPTER 10 CHIMNEYS AND FIREPLACES



X SERVICE
X SERVICE DROP
X SERVICE EQUIPMENT

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X E3601.7
X E3601.7.1
X E3601.7.2
X E3601.7.3

X E3601.8 Committee is split with adoption of new language
X E3601.1
X TABLE E3601.1.1
X E3603.1.2
X E3603.1.4
X E3604.5.1
X E3605.3
X E3606.4

X E3606.5 Committee is split with adoption of new language
X E3606.5.1 Committee is split with adoption of new language 
X E3606.5.2 Committee is split with adoption of new language
X E3606.5.3 Committee is split with adoption of new language

X E3606.7.3
X E3608.2
X E3608.7
X E3609.4.2
X E3610.2
X E3610.3
X E3611.5
X E3611.7

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X E3701.1

X X E3701.2

E3701.2 Branch-circuit and feeder ampacity. Branch circuit and feeder conductors shall 
have ampacities not less than the maximum load to be served. Where a branch circuit or a 
feeder supplies continuous loads or any combination of continuous and noncontinuous 
loads, the minimum branch circuit or feeder conductor size shall not be less than the 
larger of Section E3701.2.1 or E3701.2.2 and shall comply with Section E3705.4.

X E3701.2.1
X E3701.2.2
X E3701.3
X E3701.5.2
X E3702.10
X E3702.13
X E3703.1

CHAPTER 36 SERVICES

CHAPTER 37 BRANCH CIRCUIT AND FEEDER REQUIREMENTS



X E3703.2
X E3703.3
X E3703.4
X E3703.5
X E3704.1
X TABLE E3704.2(1)
X E3704.4
X E3705.1
X E3705.2
X E3705.3
X E3705.4.4
X E3705.5
X E3705.6
X E3705.7
X E3706.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X E3802.2.2
X E3802.5
X E3802.7
X E3803.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X E3901.1
X E3901.3
X E3901.4

X X E3901.4.2
X E3901.4.3

X E3902.1 Committee is split with adoption of new language
X E3902.2 Committee is split with adoption of new language
X E3902.3 Committee is split with adoption of new language
X E3902.4 Committee is split with adoption of new language

X E3902.5
Committee is split with adoption of new language, It was noted that language should 
reflect that this is not for habitable spaces

X E3902.6 Committee is split with adoption of new language
X E3902.7 Committee is split with adoption of new language
X E3902.8 Committee is split with adoption of new language
X E3902.9 Committee is split with adoption of new language
X E3902.10 Committee is split with adoption of new language
X E3902.11 Committee is split with adoption of new language
X E3902.12 Committee is split with adoption of new language

X E3902.13
X E3902.15
X E3902.18
X E3903.2

CHAPTER 39 POWER AND LIGHTING DISTRIBUTION

CHAPTER 38 WIRING METHODS



X E3903.3
X E3904.4
X E3905.2
X E3905.3
X E3905.3.1
X E3905.3.2
X E3905.4.2
X E3905.5
X E3905.6.3

X X E3905.8
Outlet boxes mounted in the ceilings of habitable rooms  for the installation of a ceiling 
suspended (paddle) fan shall comply with one of the following:

X E3905.10
X E3905.12.2.5
X E3906.1.1
X E3906.2
X E3906.8.2.1
X E3906.11
X E3907.1
X E3907.1.1
X E3907.1.2
X TABLE 3907.9.1(1)
X E3908.3
X E3908.6
X E3908.9
X E3908.12.1
X E3908.13
X E3908.13.1
X E3908.14
X E3908.15
X E3908.16
X E3908.17
X E3908.18
X E3908.21.2
X E3909.1

CHAPTER 40 DEVICES AND LUMINAIRES
Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 

X E4001.1
X E4001.2
X E4001.3
X E4001.10
X E4001.11
X E4001.11.1
X E4001.12
X E4001.15

X E4002.11 Committee is split with adoption of new language



X E4002.14
X E4003.3
X E4003.5
X E4003.6
X E4003.11
X E4003.12
X E4003.14
X E4004.1

X X E4004.5

E4004.5 Means of support. Luminaires shall be permitted to be supported by outlet 
boxes or fittings installed as required by Sections E3905, and E3906. Outlet boxes 
complying with Section E3905.6.3 shall be considered lighting outlets as required by 
Section E3903. [410.36(A)]

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X E4101.3
X TABLE E4101.5
X E4101.6
X E4101.8

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X E4201.1
X E4201.2
X CORROSIVE ENVIRONMENT
X DRY-NICHE LUMINAIRE
X Deleted FOUNTAIN
X WET-NICHE LUMINAIRE
X E4202.1
X E4202.2
X E4202.3
X E4202.4
X E4203.1
X E4203.1.1
X E4203.1.3
X E4203.1.4
X E4203.1.5
X E4203.1.6
X E4203.1.7
X E4203.2
X E4203.6
X E4203.7
X E4203.8
X E4204.2
X E4204.5
X E4205.1
X E4205.2

CHAPTER 42 SWIMMING POOLS

CHAPTER 41 APPLIANCE INSTALLATION



X E4205.4
X E4205.7
X E4205.9
X E4206.2
X E4206.5
X E4206.5.1
X E4206.9.2
X E4206.10
X E4206.11
X E4206.12
X E4207.1
X E4207.5
X E4207.6
X E4207.7
X E4207.8
X E4208.1
X E4208.2
X E4209.5
X E4209.6

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X E4302.1
X E4303.2
X E4303.2.4
X E4303.2.5
X E4304.1
X E4304.3
X E4304.4

CHAPTER 43 CLASS 2 REMOTE-CONTROL, SIGNALING AND POWER-LIMITED CIRCUITS



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 

X X N1101.4
“Adopt with modification to [delete] Requirement of N1101.13.5 (R401.2.5) “Advanced 
energy efficiency” in table N1105.2 (R405.2)” 

X X N1101.5
DELETE: Details shall include the following as applicable: REPLACE WITH: "Where 
required by the code official, details shall include the following as applicable:"

X Deleted ACCESSIBLE
X ACCESS (TO)
X Deleted AIR IMPERMEABLE INSULATION
X CAVITY INSULATION
X DEMAND RECIRCULATION WATER SYSTEM
X DIMMER
X DWELLING UNIT ENCLOSURE AREA
X ELECTRIC VEHICLE SUPPLY
X FENESTRATION
X HIGH-EFFICACY LIGHT SOURCES
X OCCUPANT SENSOR CONTROL
X ON-SITE RENEWABLE ENERGY
X Deleted READILY ACCESSIBLE
X READY ACCESS (TO)
X RENEWABLE ENERGY CERTIFICATE (REC)
X RENEWABLE ENERGY RESOURCES
X ROOF RECOVER
X THERMAL DISTIBUTION EFFICIENCY (TDE)
X TABLE N1101.7
X N1101.7.2
X Deleted TABLE N1101.7.2(1)
X TABLE N1101.7.2
X N1101.10.2
X N1101.10.5
X N1101.12
X N1101.13
X N1101.13.1
X N1101.13.2
X N1101.13.3
X N1101.13.4

X X N1101.13.5
X N1101.14
X N1102.1

X X N1102.1.2
X X TABLE N1102.1.2
X X TABLE N1102.1.3

CHAPTER 11 ENERGY EFFICIENCY
2021 IRC Energy



X N1102.1.3
X N1102.1.4
X Deleted N1102.1.4
X N1102.1.5
X N1102.2
X N1102.2.1
X N1102.2.2
X N1102.2.3

X X N1102.2.4
X X N1102.2.4.1

X N1102.2.5
X TABLE N1102.2.6
X Deleted N1102.2.7
X N1102.2.7
X N1102.2.8
X N1102.2.8.1
X N1102.2.9
X N1102.2.9.1
X N1102.2.10
X N1102.2.10.1
X N1102.2.12
X N1102.3
X N1102.3.5
X N1102.4
X N1102.4.1

X X TABLE N1102.4.1.1
X N1102.4.1.2
X N1102.4.1.3

X X N1102.4.6
X N1102.5
X N1103.1
X N1103.1.1
X N1103.1.2

X X N1103.2
X N1103.3
X Deleted N1103.3.1
X N1103.3.1

X X N1103.3.2
X N1103.3.3
X N1103.3.3.1
X N1103.3.4

X X N1103.3.5
X X N1103.3.6
X X N1103.3.7

X N1103.4.1



X N1103.5.1

X X N1103.5.1.1

Add the following: "Exception: Where the entire hot water piping system (both supply and 
return) are insulated with a minimum R3 insulation, the stated controls shall not be 
required."

X N1103.5.1.1.1
X N1103.5.2
X N1103.5.3
X N1103.6
X N1103.6.1
X N1103.6.2
X TABLE N1103.6.2

X X N1103.6.3
X N1103.7
X N1103.8
X N1103.9
X N1103.10
X N1103.10.1
X N1103.10.3
X N1103.11
X N1103.12

X X N1104.1
X X N1104.1.1
X X N1104.1.2
X X N1104.2
X X N1104.3
X X N1105.1

X N1105.2
X X TABLE N1105.2 DELETE: N1101.13.5 Additional energy efficiency

X Deleted N1105.3
X N1105.3.2

X X N1105.3.2.1
X X N1105.3.2.2 DELETE from item #2 "and the title page of the building plans."

X Deleted N1105.4.3
X X TABLE N1105.4.2(1)

X Deleted N1106.2
X N1106.2

X X TABLE N1106.2 DELETE: N1101.13.5 Additional energy efficiency
X X N1106.3
X X N1106.3.1
X X N1106.3.2
X X N1106.4

X X N1106.5
ADOPT contingent upon deletion (DO NOT ADOPT) Section N1101.13.5 (R401.2.5) 
Additional energy efficiency. 

X TABLE N1106.5
X N1106.6



X N1106.7
X N1106.7.2
X N1106.7.2.1
X N1106.7.2.2
X N1106.7.3
X N1107.1
X N1107.2

X X N1108.1
X X N1108.2
X X N1108.2.1
X X N1108.2.2
X X N1108.2.3
X X N1108.2.4
X X N1108.2.5

X N1109.1.1
X N1109.2
X N1110.2
X N1110.3.1
X N1110.3.2
X N1110.3.4
X N1111.1
X N1111.1.2
X N1111.1.4
X N1113.1.1



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X M1307.7

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X M1402.1
X M1411.3.1.2

X X M1411.4
X M1411.6
X M1411.8

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X M1502.3
X M1502.4.5
X M1505.1
X M1505.3
X M1505.4.2
X M1505.4.3
X TABLE M1505.4.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X M1601.1.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X M1802.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X M2006.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X TABLE M2101.1
X M2101.11
X M2101.12
X M2101.13
X M2101.13.1
X M2101.14
X M2101.15
X M2101.15.1
X M2101.15.2
X M2101.16
X M2101.16.1
X M2101.17
X M2101.17.1

2021 IRC Mechanical
CHAPTER 13 GENERAL MECHANICAL SYSTEM REQUIREMENTS

CHAPTER 14 HEATING AND COOLING EQUIPMENT AND APPLIANCES

CHAPTER 21 HYDRONIC PIPING

CHAPTER 20 BOILERS AND WATER HEATERS

CHAPTER 18 CHIMNEYS AND VENTS

CHAPTER 16 DUCT SYSTEMS

CHAPTER 15 EXHAUST SYSTEMS



X M2101.17.2
X M2101.18
X M2101.18.1
X M2101.18.2
X M2101.18.3
X M2101.19
X M2101.19.1
X M2101.19.2
X M2101.20
X M2101.20.1
X M2101.20.2
X M2101.20.3
X M2101.20.4
X M2101.21
X M2101.22
X M2101.22.1
X M2101.22.2
X M2101.22.3
X M2101.22.4
X M2101.22.5
X M2101.22.6
X M2101.23
X M2101.24
X M2101.25
X M2101.26
X M2101.27
X M2101.28
X M2101.29
X M2101.29.1
X M2101.30
X M2101.31
X M2103.1
X TABLE M2105.4
X TABLE M2105.5
X M2105.7

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X M2202.1
X M2202.2

CHAPTER 22 SPECIAL PIPING AND STORAGE SYSTEMS



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X COPPER ALLOY
X POINT OF DELIVERY
X PRESS-CONNECT JOING
X REGULATOR, MONITORING
X SERVICE METER ASSEMBLY
X SYSTEM SHUTOFF
X VALVE
X G2407.8
X G2412.5
X G2413.3
X G2413.6
X G2413.7
X G24.14.2
X G2414.8.3
X G2414.10
X G2415.5
X Deleted G2415.11.5
X G2415.18
X G2422.1
X G2427.2.1

X X G2427.2.2
G2427.2.2 (503.2.4) Appliances with integral vents.  Appliances incorporating integral 
venting means shall be installed in accordance with Section G2427.8.

X G2427.3.3

X X G2427.5.1

G2427.5.1 Factory-built chimneys. Factorybuilt chimneys shall be listed in  accordance 
with UL 103 and installed in accordance with manufacturer’s  instructions.  Factory-built 
chimneys used to vent appliances that operate at a positive vent pressure shall be listed 
for such application. 

X X G2427.5.4

3. The effective area of a chimney flue or a venting system serving two appliances with 
draft hoods, shall be not less than the area of the larger draft hood outlet plus 50 percent 
of the area of the smaller draft hood outlet. Nor greater than seven times the smallest 
draft hood outlet.

X G2427.5.5.1

CHAPTER 24 FUEL GAS
2021 IRC Plumbing/Fuel Gas



X X G2427.5.10

Insulation shield . Where a factory-built chimney passes through insulated assemblies, an 
insulation shield constructed of steel having a thickness of not less than 0.0187 inch 
(0.475 mm) (nominal 26 gage) shall be installed to provide clearance between the 
chimney and the insulation material. The clearance shall be not less than the clearance to 
combustibles specified by the chimney manufacturer’s installation instructions. Where 
chimneys pass through attic space, the shield shall terminate not less than 2 inches (51 
mm) above the installation materials and shall be secured in place to prevent 
displacement.  Insulation shields provided as part of a listed chimney
system shall be installed in accordance with the
manufacturer’s installation instructions.

X G2427.6.9.1
X G2427.7.9
X G2427.8
X FIGURE G2427.8
X TABLE G2427.8
X G2427.9
X G2427.10.3.1
X G2427.10.3.2
X G2427.10.3.3
X G2427.10.3.4
X G2427.10.7
X G2427.12.2.1
X G2427.13
X G2427.13.1
X G2427.14
X G2427.15
X G2428.2.16
X G2428.3.14
X G2432.1
X G2432.2
X G2433.1
X G2434.1
X G2435.1
X G2436.1
X G2437.1
X G2438.1
X G2439.5
X G2439.5.1
X G2441.1
X G2442.1
X G2444.1
X G2445.1
X G2446.1
X G2447.1



X G2447.2 
X G2448.1
X G2449.1
X G2450.1
X G2451.1
X G2452.3
X G2453.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X X P2503.5.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X P2708.2.1
X P2708.4
X P2709.4.1
X P2713.3
X P2721.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X P2802.1
X P2803.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X TABLE P2902.3
X P2902.3.3
X P2902.6.3
X P2903.1
X P2903.3.1
X P2904.2.1
X P2904.2.3
X P2904.3.2
X P2904.4
X P2904.4.1
X P2904.4.1.1
X P2904.4.1.2
X P2904.4.1.3
X TABLE P2904.6.2(2)

X X P2905.3
X TABLE P2906.6
X P2906.15
X P2906.21
X P2909.1
X P2912.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
CHAPTER 30 SANITARY DRAINAGE

CHAPTER 28 WATER HEATERS

CHAPTER 29 WATER SUPPLY AND DISTRIBUTION

CHAPTER 27 PLUMBING FIXTURES

CHAPTER 25 PLUMBING ADMINISTRATION



X TABLE P3002.2
X P3003.3
X P3003.3.4
X P3003.9
X P3003.9.4
X P3005.2.10.1
X P3009.1
X P3009.2
X P3009.3
X P3009.4
X P3009.5
X P3009.6
X P3009.7
X P3009.9
X TABLE 3009.9
X P3009.10
X P3011.1
X P3011.2
X P3011.3
X P3011.3.1
X P3011.4
X P3011.5
X P3011.6
X P3011.7
X P3011.7.1
X P3011.8
X P3011.9
X P3011.10



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 101.2
X 101.3
X 103.1
X 103.2
X 103.3
X 105.3.8
X 105.5.1
X 105.5.2
X Deleted 105.4
X 105.5.14
X 105.5.52
X 105.6.4
X 105.6.5
X Deleted 105.7.2
X Deleted 105.7.3
X 106.2.1
X 107.2
X 107.3
X 107.4
X 111.1
X 111.2
X 111.3
X 111.4
X 113.1
X 113.2
X 113.4
X 114.1
X 114.1.1
X 114.2
X 114.3
X 114.4
X 114.5
X 114.6

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 3D PRINTER
X ACTIVE RF EMITTING DEVICE
X ADDITIVE MANUFACTURING
X BATTERY TYPES
X Deleted CAPACITOR ARRAY
X CAPACITOR ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEM

2021 IFC

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS

CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION



X CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY
X COMBUSTIBLE LIQUID
X CRITICAL AREAS
X CURRENT TAP
X DELIVERED AUDIO QUALITY (DAQ)
X DUST COLLECTION SYSTEM
X EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE OPENING
X ENERGY STORAGE MANAGEMENT SYSTEMS
X ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEMS (ESS)
X ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEM, ELECTROCHEMICAL
X ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEM, MOBILE
X ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEM, STATIONARY
X ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEM, WALK-IN UNIT
X ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEM CABINET
X ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEM COMMISSIONING
X ENERGY STORAGE SYSTEM DECOMMISSIONING
X FLAMMABLE LIQUID
X GRADE FLOOR EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE OPENING
X LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS
X OCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION
X PASSIVE RF EMITTING DEVICE
X PORTABLE GENERATOR
X RADIO FREQUENCY (RF)
X RELOCATABLE POWER TAP
X SITE SAFETY PLAN
X Deleted STATIONARY BATTERY ARRAY
X SUPERVISORY SERVICE
X SUPERVISORY SIGNAL
X SUPERVISORY SIGNAL-INITIATING DEVICE
X TANK, MOTOR VEHICLE FUEL

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 302.1
X 310.2
X 310.2.1
X 310.3
X 310.6
X 311.2.2
X 314.4
X Table 315.7.6(1)
X 317.1
X 317.2
X 317.3
X 317.4.3
X 320.1

CHAPTER 3 GENERAL REQUIREMENTS



X 320.1.1
X 320.1.2
X 320.1.3
X 320.2
X 320.2.1
X 320.2.2
X 320.3
X 320.3.1
X 320.3.2
X 320.3.3
X 320.3.4
X 320.3.5
X 320.3.6
X 320.3.7
X 320.3.8
X 320.3.9
X 320.3.10
X 320.3.11
X 320.3.12
X 321.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 403.3.1
X 403.3.1.1
X 403.3.1.1.1
X 403.3.1.2
X Deleted 403.3.4
X 403.7.1.1
X Deleted 403.8.1.1.1
X 403.7.1.1.1
X 403.7.1.2
X 403.7.1.3
X 403.7.1.4
X Deleted 403.8.1.5
X Deleted 403.8.1.6
X Deleted 403.8.1.7
X 403.7.2
X 403.7.2.1
X 403.7.2.2
X 403.7.2.3
X 403.7.2.4
X 403.7.2.5
X 403.7.3.1
X 403.7.3.2
X 403.7.3.3

CHAPTER 4 EMERGENCY PLANNING AND PREPAREDNESS



X 403.7.3.4
X 403.7.3.5
X 403.9.2.3
X 403.9.3.1
X 403.9.3.1.1
X 403.9.3.2
X 403.9.3.3
X 403.9.3.4
X Deleted 403.10.3.5
X 403.10.1.2
X 404.3
X 404.4
X 404.4.1
X 405.1
X 405.2
X Table 405.3
X 405.5
X 405.9

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 501.3.1
X 504.3
X 508.1
X 508.1.3
X 508.1.7
X 509.1
X 509.2
X 510.1
X 510.2
X 510.3
X 510.4
X 510.4.1
X 510.4.1.1
X 510.4.2
X 510.4.2.1
X 510.4.2.2
X 510.4.2.3
X 510.4.2.4
X 510.4.2.5
X 510.4.2.6
X 510.4.2.7
X 510.4.2.8
X 510.5
X 510.5.1
X 510.5.4

CHAPTER 5 FIRE SERVICE FEATURES



X 510.5.5
X 510.6
X 510.6.1
X 510.6.2
X 510.6.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 601.1
X Deleted 601.2
X 601.2
X 601.2.1
X 602.1
X 603.1
X 603.1.1
X 603.1.2
X 603.2
X 603.2.1
X 603.2.2
X 603.4
X 603.5
X 603.5.1
X 603.5.1.1
X 603.5.2
X 603.6
X 603.6.1
X 603.8
X 603.8.1
X 604.1
X 604.5
X 604.5.1
X 604.5.2
X 604.5.3
X 604.6
X 604.6.2
X 604.6.2.1
X 604.7
X 605.1
X 605.1.1
X Deleted 603.1.2
X 605.1.2
X 605.1.3
X 605.1.4
X 605.1.5
X 605.1.5.2
X 605.1.6

CHAPTER 6 BUILDING SERVICES AND SYSTEMS



X 605.2
X 605.2.1
X 605.2.1.1
X 605.2.1.2
X 605.2.1.3
X 605.2.1.4
X 605.2.1.5
X 605.3
X 605.4
X 605.4.1
X 605.4.1.1
X 605.4.2.1
X 605.4.2.2
X 605.4.2.3
X 605.4.2.7
X 605.4.3
X 605.5
X 605.5.2.1
X 605.5.2.1.1
X 605.5.2.2
X 605.5.2.2.1
X 605.5.2.2.2
X 605.8.1
X 608.1.2
X 608.2
X 608.11
X 608.13.4
X 608.18
X 608.18.1
X 610.1
X 610.1.1
X 610.1.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 701.6
X 702.1
X 703.2
X 704.1
X 704.2
X 708.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 806.1.4
X 808.5

CHAPTER 7 FIRE SERVICE FEATURES

CHAPTER 8 INTERIOR FINISH, DECORATIVE MATERIALS AND FURNISHINGS

CHAPTER 9 FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 901.1
X 901.2
X 901.2.1
X Deleted 901.4
X 901.4
X 901.4.1
X 901.4.2
X 901.4.3
X 901.4.5
X 901.5
X 901.5.1
X 901.6
X 901.7
X 901.8
X 902.1
X 903.2.4
X 903.2.4.2
X 903.2.4.3
X 903.2.7
X 903.2.7.2 
X 903.2.9
X 903.2.9.3
X 903.2.9.4
X 903.2.10
X 903.2.10.2
X 903.2.11.3
X 903.2.11.6
X Table 903.2.11.6
X 903.3.1.2
X 903.3.1.2.2
X 903.3.1.2.3
X 903.3.2
X 903.4
X 903.4.1
X 904.12
X 904.12.1
X 904.14
X 905.3.1
X 905.3.8
X 905.9
X 905.11
X 906.1
X Table 906.1
X 907.2.2



X 907.2.3
X 907.2.10
X 907.2.13.2
X 907.2.22.2
X 907.2.23
X 907.4
X 907.4.2.4
X 907.5
X 907.5.1
X 907.5.1.1
X 907.5.2.1
X 907.5.2.1.2
X 907.5.2.1.3
X 907.5.2.1.3.1
X 907.5.2.1.3.2
X 907.5.2.2.5
X 907.5.2.3
X 907.5.2.3.3
X 907.5.2.3.3.1
X 907.6.4.2
X 907.6.6.1
X 907.6.6.2
X Deleted 907.8.4
X 908.3
X 909.6.3
X 909.17
X 909.2
X 909.20.1
X 909.20.2
X 909.20.2.1
X 909.20.3
X 909.20.3.1
X 909.20.3.2
X 909.20.3.3
X 909.20.4
X 909.20.4.1
X 909.20.4.2
X 909.20.4.2.1
X 909.20.4.3
X 909.20.4.4
X 909.20.5
X 909.20.6
X 909.20.6.1
X 909.20.6.2
X 909.20.6.3



X 910.3.4
X 910.3.5
X 911.1
X Table 911.1
X 911.4
X 913.1
X 913.2.2
X 914.2.4
X 914.3.1
X 914.3.1.2
X 914.3.3
X 9214.3.6
X 914.7
X 914.7.1
X 914.7.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1103.2
X 1103.5.4
X 1103.7.5.1
X 1103.9
X Table 1104.18
X 1105.5.4.2.2
X 1105.5.4.2.4
X 1105.5.4.2.5
X 1105.6.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1201.1
X 1201.2
X 1201.3
X 1202.1
X 1203.1.2
X 1203.2.3
X 1203.2.4
X 1203.2.5
X 1203.2.7
X 1203.4.1
X 1203.5.1
X 1204.1
X 1204.2
X 1204.3
X 1204.4
X 1204.4
X 1204.5

CHAPTER 11 CONSTRUCTION REQUIREMENTS FOR EXISTING BUILDINGS

CHAPTER 12 ENERGY SYSTEMS



X 1204.6
X 1204.7
X 1204.8
X 1204.9
X 1204.10
X 1205.1
X 1205.2
X 1205.2.1
X 1205.2.3
X 1205.3.3
X 1205.5
X Deleted 1206.1
X Deleted 1206.2
X Deleted 1206.2.1
X Deleted 1206.2.2
X Deleted 1206.2.3.1
X Deleted 1206.2.3.2
X Deleted 1206.2.3.3
X Deleted 1206.2.4
X Deleted 1206.2.5
X Deleted 1206.2.6
X Deleted 1206.2.7
X Deleted 1206.2.8
X Deleted 1206.2.8.1
X Deleted 1206.2.8.2
X Deleted 1206.2.8.3
X Deleted 1206.2.8.4
X Deleted 1206.2.8.5
X Deleted 1206.2.8.5.1
X Deleted 1206.2.8.6
X Deleted 1206.2.8.6.1
X Deleted 1206.2.8.6.2
X Deleted 1206.2.8.7
X Deleted 1206.2.8.7.1
X Deleted 1206.2.8.7.2
X Deleted 1206.2.8.7.3
X Deleted 1206.2.8.7.4
X Deleted 1206.2.9
X Deleted 1206.2.9.1
X Deleted 1206.2.10
X Deleted 1206.2.10.1
X Deleted 1206.2.10.2
X Deleted 1206.2.10.3
X Deleted 1206.2.10.4
X Deleted 1206.2.10.5



X Deleted 1206.2.10.6
X Deleted 1206.2.10.7
X Deleted 1206.2.10.8
X Deleted 1206.2.11
X Deleted 1206.2.11.1
X Deleted 1206.2.11.1.1
X Deleted 1206.2.11.2
X Deleted 1206.2.11.3
X Deleted 1206.2.11.3.1
X Deleted 1206.2.11.3.2
X Deleted 1206.2.11.4
X Deleted 1206.2.11.4.1
X Deleted 1206.2.11.5
X Deleted 1206.2.12
X Deleted 1206.2.12.1
X Deleted 1206.2.12.2
X Deleted 1206.2.12.3
X Deleted 1206.2.12.4
X Deleted 1206.2.12.5
X Deleted 1206.2.12.6
X Deleted 1206.3
X Deleted 1206.3.1
X Deleted 1206.3.2
X Deleted 1206.3.2.1
X Deleted 1206.3.2.2
X Deleted 1206.3.2.3
X Deleted 1206.3.2.4
X Deleted 1206.3.2.5
X Deleted 1206.3.2.6
X Deleted 1206.3.2.6.1
X Deleted 1206.3.2.6.2
X Deleted 1206.3.2.6.3
X Deleted 1206.3.2.6.4
X Deleted 1206.3.3
X Deleted 1206.3.4
X Deleted 1206.3.4.1
X Deleted 1206.3.4.2
X Deleted 1206.3.4.3
X Deleted 1206.3.4.4
X Deleted 1206.3.4.5
X Deleted 1206.3.5
X Deleted 1206.3.5.1
X Deleted 1206.3.5.1.1
X Deleted 1206.3.5.2
X Deleted 1206.3.5.3



X Deleted 1206.3.5.3.1
X Deleted 1206.3.5.4
X Deleted 1206.3.6
X 1206.1
X 1206.5
X 1206.12
X 1206.14
X 1207.1
X 1207.1.1
X TABLE 1207.1.1
X 1207.1.2
X 1207.1.2.1
X 1207.1.3
X 1207.1.4
X 1207.1.4.1
X 1207.1.4.2
X 1207.1.4.3
X 1207.1.5
X 1207.1.6
X 1207.1.6.1
X 1207.1.6.2
X 1207.2
X 1207.2.1
X 1207.2.1.1
X 1207.2.1.2
X 1207.2.2
X 1207.2.2.1
X 1207.2.3
X 1207.3
X 1207.3.1
X 1207.3.2
X 1207.3.3
X 1207.3.4
X 1207.3.5
X 1207.3.6
X 1207.3.7
X 1207.3.7.1
X 1207.3.8
X 1207.3.9
X 1207.4
X 1207.4.1
X 1207.4.2
X 1207.4.3
X 1207.4.4
X 1207.4.5



X 1207.4.6
X 1207.4.7
X 1207.4.8
X 1207.4.9
X 1207.4.10
X 1207.4.11
X 1207.4.12
X 1207.5
X TABLE 1207.5
X 1207.5.1
X 1207.5.2
X 1207.5.3
X 1207.5.4
X 1207.5.4.1
X 1207.5.5
X 1207.5.5.1
X 1207.5.6
X 1207.5.7
X 1207.5.8
X 1207.6
X TABLE 1207.6
X 1207.6.1
X 1207.6.1.1
X 1207.6.1.2
X 1207.6.1.2.1
X 1207.6.1.2.2
X 1207.6.1.2.3
X 1207.6.1.2.4
X 1207.6.2
X 1207.6.2.1
X 1207.6.2.2
X 1207.6.2.3
X 1207.6.3
X 1207.6.4
X 1207.6.5
X 1207.7
X TABLE 1207.7
X 1207.7.1
X 1207.7.2
X 1207.7.3
X 1207.7.4
X 1207.8
X TABLE 1207.8
X 1207.8.1
X 1207.8.2



X 1207.8.3
X 1207.8.4
X 1207.9
X TABLE 1207.9
X 1207.9.1
X 1207.9.2
X 1207.9.3
X 1207.9.4
X 1207.9.5
X 1207.9.6
X 1207.10
X TABLE 1207.10
X 1207.10.1
X 1207.10.2
X 1207.10.3
X 1207.10.4
X 1207.10.4.1
X 1207.10.5
X 1207.10.6
X 1207.10.7
X 1207.10.7.1
X 1207.10.7.2
X 1207.10.7.3
X 1207.10.7.4
X 1207.10.7.5
X 1207.10.7.6
X 1207.11
X 1207.11.1
X 1207.11.2
X 1207.11.3
X 1207.11.4
X 1207.11.5
X 1207.11.6
X 1207.11.7
X 1207.11.8
X 1207.11.9
X 1207.11.10

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 2201.1
X 2202.1
X Deleted 2203.1
X Deleted 2203.2
X Deleted 2203.3
X Deleted 2203.4

CHAPTER 22 COMBUSTIBLE DUST-PRODUCING OPERATIONS



X 2203.1
X TABLE 2203.1
X 2203.2
X 2203.2.1
X 2203.2.1.1
X 2203.2.1.2
X 2203.2.1.3
X 2203.3
X 2203.3.1
X 2203.3.1.1
X 2203.3.1.2
X TABLE 2203.3.1.2
X 2203.3.2
X 2203.3.3
X 2203.4
X 2203.4.1
X 2203.4.2
X 2203.4.3
X 2203.4.3.1
X 2203.4.4
X 2203.4.5
X 2203.4.6
X 2203.4.7
X 2203.4.8
X 2203.4.9
X 2203.4.9.1
X 2203.4.9.2
X 2203.4.9.3
X 2203.4.9.4
X 2203.4.9.5
X 2203.5
X 2203.6
X 2203.7
X 2203.8
X Deleted 2204.1
X Deleted TABLE 2204.1
X 2204.1
X 2204.2
X 2205.1
X TABLE 2205.1
X 2205.1.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 2303.1
X 2304.2.4

CHAPTER 23 MOTOR FUEL-DISPENSING FACILITIES AND REPAIR GARAGES



X 2308.1
X 2308.2
X 2308.2.3
X 2308.2.4
X 2309.1
X 2309.2.2
X 2309.4
X 2309.6
X 2311.8
X 2311.8.11

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 2404.3.3.6

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X Table 2704.2.2.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 2808.3
X 2808.3.1
X 2808.4
X 2810.1
X 2810.2
X 2810.3
X 2810.4
X 2810.10
X 2810.11

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 3006.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 3103.3.1
X 3104.2
X 3104.3
X 3104.4
X 3107.15.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 3201.3
X Table 3203.8
X 3205.1
X 3205.5
X 3206.3.1
X 3208.1.1

CHAPTER 32 HIGH-PILED COMBUSTIBLE STORAGE

CHAPTER 28 LUMBER YARDS AND AGRO-INDUSTRIAL, SOLID BIOMASS AND WOODWORKING FACILITIES

CHAPTER 30 INDUSTRIAL OVENS

CHAPTER 31 TENTS AND OTHER MEMBRANE STRUCTURES

CHAPTER 27 SEMICONDUCTOR FABRICATION FACILITIES

CHAPTER 24 FLAMMABLE FINISHES



X 3209.4 
X 3209.4.1
X 3209.4.2
X 3210.1
X 3210.1.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 3303.1
X 3303.1.1
X 3303.2
X 3303.3
X 3303.3.1
X 3303.4
X 3303.5
X 3303.6
X 3303.7
X 3303.8
X 3303.9
X 3305.5
X 3305.5.1
X 3305.5.2
X 3305.5.2.1
X 3305.5.2.2
X 3305.5.2.3
X 3305.5.3
X 3305.5.4
X 3305.8
X 3305.9
X 3309.1
X 3313.1
X 3313.2
X 3313.3
X 3313.3.1
X 3313.3.2
X 3313.3.3
X 3313.4
X 3313.5

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 3504.3.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 3805.2.1
X 3805.2.2
X 3805.4

CHAPTER 33 FIRE SAFETY DURING CONSTRUCTION AND DEMOLITION

CHAPTER 35 WELDING AND OTHER HOT WORK

CHAPTER 38 HIGHER EDUCATION LABORATORIES



X Table 3805.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 3901.2
X 3904.2
X 3904.2.1
X 3904.2.2
X 3905.1
X Deleted 3905.1.1
X Deleted 3905.1.2
X 3905.1.1
X 3905.1.2
X Deleted 3905.1.5

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 4001.1
X 4001.1.1
X 4002.1
X 4003.1
X 4003.2
X 4003.3
X 4003.3.1
X 4003.3.2
X 4003.3.3
X 4003.3.4
X 4003.4
X 4004.1
X 4004.2
X 4004.3
X 4004.4
X 4005.1
X 4005.2
X 4006.1
X 4006.1.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 5001.1
X Table 5003.1.1(3)
X 5003.2.2.1
X 5003.7.4
X Table 5003.8.2
X 5003.8.3.3
X Table 5003.11.1
X 5003.12
X 5004.3

CHAPTER 39 PROCESSING AND EXTRACTION FACILITIES

CHAPTER 40 STORAGE OF DISTILLED SPIRITS AND WINES

CHAPTER 50 HAZARDOUS MATERIALS—GENERAL PROVISIONS



X 5004.14
X 5005.1.8
X 5005.3.3
X 5005.4.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 5101.1
X 5101.4
X 5103.2.3
X 5104.1.1
X 5104.1.2
X 5104.1.3
X 5104.2.2
X Table 5104.3.2
X 5104.7
X Table 5104.7
X 5105.1
X Table 5105.1
X 5106.1
X 5106.2.1
X Table 5106.2.1
X 5106.2.2
X 5106.3.2
X 5106.3.3
X Table 5106.4
X 5106.5.7

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 5306.1.1
X 5306.2.2
X 5306.5

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 5601.1.3
X 5604.6.5
X 5606.1
X 5606.6
X 5606.6.1
X 5606.6.2
X 5606.6.3
X 5606.6.4
X 5606.6.5
X 5606.6.6
X 5606.6.7
X 5606.6.8

CHAPTER 51 AEROSOLS

CHAPTER 53 COMPRESSED GASES

CHAPTER 56 EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 5701.2
X TABLE 5703.6.2
X 5704.2.11.4.2.1
X 5704.2.13.1.5
X 5704.3.5.1
X 5704.3.7.5.1
X 5707.1.1
X 5707.2
X 5707.2.1
X 5707.2.2
X 5707.3.3
X 5707.4
X 5707.4.1
X 5707.4.3
X 5707.5.1
X 5707.5.2
X 5707.5.3
X 5707.5.4
X 5707.6.3
X 5707.6.4
X 5707.6.5

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 6103.2.1.1
X 6110.1
X 6110.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 6303.1.4
X Table 6303.1.4
X Table 6304.1.5(1)
X Table 6304.1.5(2)

CHAPTER 63 OXIDIZERS, OXIDIZING GASES AND OXIDIZING CRYO-GENIC FLUIDS

CHAPTER 57 FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS

CHAPTER 61 LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GASES



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1002.1
X 1003.5
X 1006.2.1
X 1006.2.2
X 1006.2.2.2
X 1006.2.2.4
X 1006.3
X 1006.3.1
X 1006.3.2
X 1006.3.4
X TABLE 1006.3.4(1)
X TABLE 1006.3.4(2)
X 1008.2.1
X 1008.3.1
X 1008.3.2
X 1009.2.1
X 1009.6.2
X 1009.6.3
X 1009.8.1
X 1010.1
X 1010.1.1
X 1010.1.1.1
X 1010.1.2
X 1010.1.2.1
X Deleted 1010.1.3
X 1010.1.3
X 1010.1.3.2
X 1010.1.4
X 1010.2.1
X 1010.2.4
X 1010.2.8
X Deleted 1010.1.4.4.1
X 1010.2.9
X 1010.2.9.1
X 1010.2.9.2
X 1010.2.12
X 1010.2.13
X 1010.2.13.1
X 1010.2.14
X 1010.3.1
X 1010.3.3

2021 IFC
CHAPTER 10 MEANS OF EGRESS



X 1010.3.4
X 1010.5.2
X 1011.5.2
X 1011.6
X 1011.7
X 1011.11
X 1011.15
X 1011.16
X 1013.4
X 1015.2
X 1015.7
X 1015.8
X 1016.2
X TABLE 1017.2
X 1017.3
X 1017.3.2
X 1017.3.2.1
X 1017.3.2.2
X 1017.3.2.3
X 1019.3
X 1020.1
X TABLE 1020.2
X 1020.5
X 1020.6
X 1023.2
X 1023.5
X 1023.8
X 1023.9
X 1023.11
X 1024.6
X 1024.8
X 1027.1
X 1028.1
X 1028.2
X 1029.1
X 1030.6.2
X 1030.6.2.3
X 1030.6.3.1
X TABLE 1030.13.2.1
X 1030.16
X 1030.16.1
X 1030.1
X 1031.2
X 1031.3
X 1031.4



X 1031.5
X 1031.5.1
X 1031.5.2
X 1031.5.2.1
X 1031.5.2.2
X 1031.5.3
X 1031.6
X 1032.2.1.1
X 1032.3.1
X 1032.7
X 1032.8



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 101.2
X 101.3
X 103.1
X 109.1
X Deleted 109.1.1
X 109.2
X 109.3
X 109.4
X 109.5
X 109.6
X 110.1
X 112.2
X 112.3
X 113.1
X 113.2
X 113.3
X 113.4
X 114.1
X 114.2
X 114.3
X 114.4
X 115.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X BALANCED VENTILATION
X CEILING RADIATION DAMPER
X DIRECT EVAPORATIVE COOLING
X FLAMMABILITY CLASSIFICATION REFREGERANT
X INDIRECT EVAPORATIVE COOLING
X LARGE-DIAMETER CEILING FAN
X PRESS-CONNECT JOINT
X REFRIGERANT SAFETY GROUP CLASSIFICATION
X TOXICITY CLASSIFICATION (REFRIGERANT)
X UNVENTED ALCOHOL FUEL BURNING DECORATIVE APPLIANCE

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 301.18
X 304.11
X 307.1.1
X 307.2.1.1
X 307.2.2

CHAPTER 3 GENERAL REGULATIONS

2021 IMC
CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS



X 307.2.3.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 401.2
X 401.4
X 403.2.1
X 403.3.1.3
X Deleted 403.3.1.5
X 403.3.2.1
X 403.3.2.5
X 407.1
X Table 403.3.1.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 501.2
X 501.3.1
X 502.9.5
X 502.20.1
X 504.4.1
X 504.6
X 505.3
X 506.3.7
X 506.3.9
X 506.5.2
X 507.1
X 507.6.1
X Deleted 510.4
X 510.5.5
X 511.1
X 511.1.5
X 514.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 601.2
X 601.5
X 602.2
X 602.2.1.8
X 603.5.1
X 604.3
X 607.2
X 607.2.3
X 607.3.1
X 607.3.3.1
X 607.4
X 607.4.1

CHAPTER 6 DUCT SYSTEMS

CHAPTER 5 EXHAUST SYSTEMS

CHAPTER 4 VENTILATION



X 607.4.1.1
X 607.4.1.2
X 607.4.2
X 607.5.2
X 607.5.5
X 607.5.5.1
X 607.6.2.1.1
X 607.6.2.1.2
X 608.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 801.21

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 905.1
X 908.1
X 916.1
X 918.1
X 918.2
X 920.4
X 929.1
X 930.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1004.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1101.1
X 1101.1.1
X 1101.1.2
X 1101.2
X Table 1101.2
X Deleted 1101.6
X Table 1103.1
X 1104.2.2
X Table 1104.3.2
X 1104.3.3
X 1104.3.4
X 1105.6.3
X Deleted 1105.8
X 1105.8
X 1105.9
X Deleted 1106.3
X 1106.3
X 1106.4

CHAPTER 9 SPECIFIC APPLIANCES, FIREPLACES AND SOLID FUEL-BURNING EQUIPMENT

CHAPTER 8 CHIMNEYS AND VENTS

CHAPTER 11 REFRIGERATION

CHAPTER 10 BOILERS, WATER HEATERS AND PRESSURE VESSELS



X 1106.4.1
X Deleted SECTION 1107
X 1107.1
X 1107.2
X 1107.3
X 1107.4
X TABLE 1107.4
X 1107.4.1
X 1107.5
X TABLE 1107.5
X 1107.5.1
X TABLE 1107.5.1
X 1107.6
X 1107.7
X Deleted SECTION 1108
X 1108.1
X 1108.1.1
X 1108.2
X 1108.3
X 1108.3.1
X 1108.3.2
X 1108.3.2.1
X 1108.3.2.2
X 1108.3.3
X 1108.3.4
X 1108.3.5
X 1108.4
X 1108.5
X 1108.6
X 1108.7
X 1108.8
X 1108.9
X 1109.1
X 1109.2
X 1109.2.1
X 1109.2.2
X 1109.2.3
X 1109.2.4
X 1109.2.5
X 1109.2.6
X 1109.2.7
X 1109.3
X 1109.3.1
X 1109.3.2
X TABLE 1109.3.2



X 1109.4
X 1109.4.1
X 1109.4.2
X 1109.5
X 1109.6
X 1109.7
X 1109.8
X 1109.8.1
X 1109.8.2
X 1109.8.3
X 1109.8.4
X 1110.1
X 1110.2
X 1110.3
X 1110.4
X 1110.5
X 1110.5.1
X 1110.5.2
X 1110.6
X 1110.7
X 1110.8

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X Table 1202.4
X Table 1202.5
X 1203.3.4
X 1203.7
X 1203.8
X 1203.10.3
X 1203.15.3
X 1209.5
X 1209.5.2
X Table 1210.4
X Table 1210.5
X 1210.6.2
X 1210.8

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1301.4
X Table 1302.3
X 1302.8
X 1302.9
X 1303.3
X 1303.3.2
X 1303.3.5

CHAPTER 13 FUEL OIL PIPING AND STORAGE

CHAPTER 12 HYDRONIC PIPING



X 1303.4
X 1303.5
X 1303.7
X 1303.8

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1402.8.1.2
X 1404.1

CHAPTER 14 SOLAR SYSTEMS



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 101.2
X 101.3
X 103.1
X 109.1
X 109.2
X 109.3
X 109.4
X 109.5
X 110.1
X 112.2
X 112.3
X 113.1
X 113.2
X 113.3
X 113.4
X 114.1
X 114.2
X 114.3
X 114.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X COPPER ALLOY
X DUAL FLUSHING DEVICE
X GROUP WASH FIXTURE
X PRIVATE
X PUBLIC OR PUBLIC UTILIZATION
X PUSH-FIT FITTIN
X WATER DISPENSER

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 308.2
X 308.9
X 312.10.2
X 314.2.1.1
X 314.2.2
X 314.2.3.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X X 403.1.1
X X 403.1.2
X X 403.2

2021 IPC
Chapter 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

Chapter 2 DEFINITIONS

Chapter 3 GENERAL REGULATIONS

Chapter 4 FIXTURES, FAUCETS AND FIXTURE FITTINGS



X 403.3.1
X 403.3.3
X 403.5
X 403.6
X 404.1
X 404.2
X Deleted 404.3
X 405.3.1
X 405.4.3
X 407.2
X 408.1
X 410.1
X 410.3
X 410.3.1
X 410.3.2
X 410.4
X 411.3
X 412.3
X 412.4
X 412.5
X 412.1
X 412.11
X 416.1
X 419.1
X 419.3
X 421.1
X 421.3.1
X 425.1.1
X 425.1.2
X 425.1.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 501.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 602.3.5
X TABLE 605.3
X 605.12.3
X 605.13.6
X 605.13.7
X 606.1
X Deleted 606.7
X 607.1.1
X 607.1.2
X 607.2.2

Chapter 5 WATER HEATERS

Chapter 6 WATER SUPPLY AND DISTRIBUTION



X Table 608.1
X 608.14.3
X 608.15.2.1
X 608.17.2
X 608.17.4
X 608.17.4.1
X 609.2
X 609.2.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 705.2.4
X 705.10.4
X 708.1
X 708.1.6
X 717.1
X 717.2
X 717.3
X 717.3.1
X 717.4
X 717.5
X 717.6
X 717.7
X 717.7.1
X 717.8
X 717.9
X 717.1
X 718.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 903.1
X 903.1.1
X 903.1.2
X 903.1.3
X 903.1.4
X Deleted 903.6
X 915.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1002.1
X 1002.4.1
X 1002.4.1.5

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1102.6
X 1106.2

Chapter 7 SANITARY DRAINAGE

Chapter 9 VENTS

Chapter 10 TRAPS, INTERCEPTORS AND SEPARATORS

Chapter 11 STORM DRAINAGE



X 1106.2.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1202.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1301.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 1401.1
X 1401.2
X 1401.3
X 1401.4
X 1401.5
X 1401.6
X 1402.1
X 1402.3
X TABLE 1402.3
X 1403.1

Chapter 14 SUBSURFACE LANDSCAPE IRRIGATION SYSTEMS

Chapter 13 NONPOTABLE WATER SYSTEMS

Chapter 12 SPECIAL PIPING AND STORAGE SYSTEMS



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 101.2
X 101.4
X 103.1
X 107.1
X 109.2
X 109.3
X 109.5
X 109.6
X 110.3
X 113.1
X 113.2
X 113.3
X 113.4
X 114.1
X 116.1
X 116.2
X 116.3
X 116.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X POINT OF DELIVERY
X PRESS-CONNECT JOINT
X SERVICE METER ASSEMBLY
X SYSTEM SHUTOFF
X VALVE - Service shutoff

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 303.3.1
X 304.8
X 306.6
X 307.2
X 307.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 401.5
X 402.3
X 402.6
X 402.7
X Deleted 403.3
X 403.8.3
X 403.1

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS

CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION
2021 IFGC

CHAPTER 3 GENERAL REGULATIONS

CHAPTER 4 GAS PIPING INSTALLATIONS



X 404.5
X Deleted 404.11.5
X 404.18
X 411.1
X 413.2.3
X 413.2.4
X 413.4
X Deleted 413.5

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 503.2.3
X 503.2.4
X 503.2.5
X 503.3.3
X 503.5.1
X 503.5.5
X 503.5.6.1
X 503.5.11
X 503.6.10.1
X 503.6.10.4
X 503.6.11
X 503.8
X Table 503.8
X Figure 503.8
X 503.9
X 503.10.2.5
X 503.10.3.1
X 503.10.3.2
X 503.10.3.3
X 503.10.3.4
X 503.10.7
X 503.13
X 503.13.1
X 503.14
X 503.15
X 504.2.16
X 504.3.12
X 504.3.13
X 504.3.18

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 602.1
X 602.2
X 603.1
X 604.1

CHAPTER 6 SPECIFIC APPLIANCES

CHAPTER 5 CHIMNEYS AND VENTS



X 605.1
X 608.1
X 609.1
X 610.1
X 611.2
X 612.2
X 613.1
X 614.4.1
X 614.6
X 614.7.1
X 617.1
X 618.1
X 618.6
X 620.1
X 621.1
X 622.1
X 623.1
X 623.2
X 624.1
X 625.1
X 627.1
X 628.1
X 630.1
X Deleted 634
X 635.1

CHAPTER 7 GASEOUS HYDROGEN SYSTEMS No Change



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X C102.1
X C102.1.1
X C103.1
X C103.2
X C109.1
X C109.2
X C109.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X BIOGAS
X BIOMASS
X COMPUTER ROOM
X DATA CENTER
X DATA CENTER SYSTEMS
X DEMAND RECIRCULATION WATER SYSTEM
X DIRECT DIGITAL CONTROL (DDC)
X ENTHALPY RECOVERY RATIO
X FAN, EMBEDDED
X FAN ARRAY
X FAN ENERGY INDEX (FEI)
X FAN NAMEPLATE ELECTRICAL INPUT POWER
X FAN SYSTEM ELECTRICAL INPUT POWER
X FAULT DETECTION AND DIAGNOSTICES (FDD) SYSTEM
X FENESTRATION
X GENERAL LIGHTING
X GREENHOUSE
X INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT (ITE)
X INTERNAL CURTAIN SYSTEM
X LARGE-DIAMETER CEILING FAN
X NETWORKED GUESTROOM CONTROL SYSTEM
X ON-SITE RENEWABLE ENERGY
X RENEWABLE ENERGY RESOURCES
X TESTING UNIT ENCLOSURE AREA
X THERMAL DISTRIBUTION EFFICIENCY (TDE)
X VEGETATIVE ROOF
X VISIBLE TRANSMITTANCE, ANNUAL [VTannual]
X WALL, ABOVE-GRADE

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X C301.3
X C303.1.2

2021 IECC
CHAPTER C1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

CHAPTER C2 GENERAL DEFINITIONS

CHAPTER C3 GENERAL REQUIREMENTS



X FIGURE C301.1
X TABLE C301.1
X Deleted TABLE C301.3(1)
X TABLE C301.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X C401.2
X C401.2.1
X C401.2.2
X C401.3
X C402.1
X C402.1.1
X C402.1.1.1
X TABLE C402.1.1.1
X C402.1.2

X X C402.1.3
X TABLE C402.1.3
X TABLE C402.1.4
X C402.1.4
X C402.1.4.1
X C402.1.4.1.1
X C402.1.4.1.2
X C402.1.4.1.3
X C402.1.4.2
X C402.2
X C402.2.1
X C402.2.1.1
X C402.2.1.2
X C402.2.1.3
X C402.2.1.4
X C402.2.4
X C402.2.4.1
X C402.2.7
X C402.3
X C402.4
X TABLE C402.4
X C402.4.1.1
X C402.4.1.2
X C402.4.2
X C402.4.2.1
X C402.4.2.2
X C402.4.3.1
X C402.4.3.2
X C402.4.4
X C402.4.5

CHAPTER C4 COMMERCIAL ENERGY EFFICIENCY



X C402.4.5.1
X C402.4.5.2

X X C402.5
X C402.5.1
X C402.5.1.2
X C402.5.1.3
X C402.5.1.4
X C402.5.1.5
X C402.5.2
X C402.5.3
X C402.5.9
X C402.5.11
X C402.5.11.1
X C403.1
X C403.1.2
X TABLE C403.1.2(1)
X TABLE C403.1.2(2)
X C403.2
X C403.2.1
X C403.2.2
X C403.2.3
X C403.3
X C403.3.1
X C403.3.2
X Deleted TABLE C403.3.2(1)
X Deleted TABLE C403.3.2(2)
X Deleted TABLE C403.3.2(3)
X Deleted TABLE C403.3.2(4)
X Deleted TABLE C403.3.2(5)
X Deleted TABLE C403.3.2(6)
X Deleted TABLE C403.3.2(7)
X Deleted TABLE C403.3.2(8)
X Deleted TABLE C403.3.2(9)
X Deleted TABLE C403.3.2(10)
X TABLE C403.3.2(1)
X TABLE C403.3.2(2)
X TABLE C403.3.2(3)
X TABLE C403.3.2(4)
X TABLE C403.3.2(5)
X TABLE C403.3.2(6)
X TABLE C403.3.2(7)
X TABLE C403.3.2(8)
X TABLE C403.3.2(9)
X TABLE C403.3.2(10)
X TABLE C403.3.2(11)



X TABLE C403.3.2(12)
X TABLE C403.3.2(13)
X TABLE C403.3.2(14)
X TABLE C403.3.2(15)
X TABLE C403.3.2(16)
X C403.3.2.1
X C403.3.2.2
X C403.4
X C403.4.1
X C403.4.1.1
X C403.4.1.3
X C403.4.1.4
X C403.4.1.5
X C403.4.2
X C403.4.2.1
X C403.4.2.2
X C403.4.2.3
X C403.4.3.3.3
X TABLE C403.4.4
X C403.5
X TABLE C403.5(1)
X TABLE C403.5.3.3
X C403.5.5
X C403.6.1
X C403.6.5
X C403.6.5.1
X C403.7
X C403.7.1
X C403.7.2
X C403.7.3
X C403.7.4

X X C403.7.4.1
X C403.7.4.2
X C403.7.5
X C403.7.6
X C403.7.6.1
X C403.7.6.2
X C403.7.7
X C403.8.1
X C403.8.2
X C403.8.3
X C403.8.4
X C403.8.5
X TABLE C403.8.5
X C403.8.6.1



X C403.9
X Deleted C403.10.3
X Deleted TABLE C403.10.1(1)
X Deleted TABLE C403.10.1(2)
X C403.11
X C403.11.1
X TABLE C403.11.1
X C403.11.2
X C403.11.2.1
X TABLE C403.11.2.1(3)
X C403.12
X C403.12.1
X C403.12.2
X C403.12.2.1
X C403.12.2.2
X C403.12.2.3
X C403.12.3
X C403.12.3.1
X C403.13
X C403.14
X C404.2.1
X C404.4
X C404.5.2.1
X TABLE C404.5.2
X C404.6.1
X C404.6.1.1
X C404.8
X C404.8.3
X C404.9
X C405.1
X C405.1.1
X C405.2
X C405.2.1
X C405.2.1.1
X C405.2.1.2
X C405.2.1.3
X C405.2.1.4
X C405.2.2
X C405.2.2.1
X C405.2.3
X C405.2.3.1
X C405.2.4
X C405.2.4.1
X C405.2.4.2
X C405.2.4.3



X C405.2.4.4
X FIGURE C405.2.4.4
X C405.2.5
X C405.2.7
X C405.2.7.2
X C405.2.7.3
X C405.2.8
X C405.3
X C405.3.1
X C405.3.2
X Deleted C405.3.2.1
X C405.3.2.1
X TABLE C405.3.2(1)
X TABLE C405.3.2(2)
X Deleted C405.3.2.2
X C405.3.2.2
X C405.3.2.2.1
X C405.4
X C405.5
X Deleted C405.4.2
X C405.5.2
X C405.5.2.1
X C405.5.3

X X C405.6
X C405.7
X C405.8
X C405.9.2
X C405.9.2.1
X C405.10

X X C405.11
X C405.11.1

X X C405.12
X C405.12.1
X C405.12.2
X TABLE C405.12.2
X C405.12.3
X C405.12.4
X C405.12.5
X C406.1
X C406.1.1
X TABLE C406.1(1)
X TABLE C406.1(2)
X TABLE C406.1(3)
X TABLE C406.1(4)
X TABLE C406.1(5)



X C406.2
X C406.2.1
X C406.2.2
X C406.2.3
X C406.2.4
X C406.2.5
X C406.3
X C406.3.1
X C406.3.2
X C406.3.3
X C406.4
X C406.5
X C406.5.1
X C406.5.2
X C406.6
X C406.7
X C406.7.1
X C406.7.2
X C406.7.3
X C406.7.4
X C406.10
X C406.10.1
X C406.10.2
X TABLE C406.10.2
X C406.10.3
X C406.10.4
X C406.10.5
X C406.11
X C406.12
X TABLE C406.12(1)
X TABLE C406.12(2)
X TABLE C406.12(3)
X TABLE C406.12(4)
X Deleted C407.2
X C407.2
X TABLE C407.2
X C407.3.2
X C407.4.1
X TABLE C407.4.1(1)
X C407.4.2
X C407.5
X C408.2.3.1
X C408.3.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
CHAPTER C5 EXISTING BUILDINGS



X C501.2
X C502.1
X C502.2
X C502.3
X C502.3.1
X C502.3.2
X C502.3.3
X C502.3.6
X Deleted C503.2
X C503.2.1
X C503.3
X C503.4
X C503.5

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X R102.1
X R102.1.1
X R103.1
X R103.2
X R104.2
X R109.1
X R109.2
X R109.4
X R110.1
X R110.2
X R110.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X Deleted ACCESSIBLE
X ACCESS (TO)
X Deleted AIR IMPERMEABLE INSULATION
X CAVITY INSULATION
X DEMAND RECIRCULATION WATER SYSTEM
X DIMMER
X DWELLING UNIT ENCLOSURE AREA (New)
X FENESTRATION
X HIGH-EFFICACY LIGHT SOURCES
X OCCUPANT SENSOR CONTROL
X ON-SITE RENEWABLE ENERGY
X Deleted READILY ACCESSIBLE
X READY ACCESS (TO)
X RENEWABLE ENERGY CERTIFICATE (REC)
X RENEWABLE ENERGY RESOURCES
X ROOF RECOVER
X THERMAL DISTRIBUTION EFFICIENCY (TDE)

CHAPTER R2 DEFINITIONS

CHAPTER R1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X FIGURE R301.1
X TABLE R301.1
X R301.3
X TABLE R301.3
X Deleted TABLE R301.3(1)
X R303.1.2
X R303.1.5
X R303.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X R401.2
X R401.2.1
X R401.2.2
X R401.2.3
X R401.2.4

X X R401.2.5
X R401.3
X R402.1
X R402.1.2
X R402.1.3
X Deleted R402.1.4
X R402.1.4
X TABLE R402.1.2

X X TABLE R402.1.3
X R402.1.5
X R402.2
X R402.2.1
X R402.2.2
X R402.2.3
X R402.2.4
X R402.2.4.1
X R402.2.5
X TABLE R402.2.6
X Deleted R402.2.7
X R402.2.7
X R402.2.8
X R402.2.8.1
X R402.2.9
X R402.2.9.1
X R402.2.10
X R402.2.10.1
X R402.2.12
X R402.3

CHAPTER R4 RESIDENTIAL ENERGY EFFICIENCY

CHAPTER R3 GENERAL REQUIREMENTS



X R402.3.5
X R402.4

X X TABLE R402.4.1.1
X R402.4.1.2
X R402.4.1.3

X X R402.4.6
X R402.5
X R403.1
X R403.1.1
X R403.1.2
X R403.2

X X R403.2.3
X Deleted R403.3.1
X R403.3.1
X R403.3.2
X R403.3.3
X R403.3.3.1
X R403.3.4
X R403.3.5
X R403.3.6

X X R403.3.7
X R403.4
X R403.5.1
X R403.5.1.1
X R403.5.1.1.1
X R403.5.2
X R403.5.3
X R403.6
X R403.6.1
X R403.6.2
X TABLE R403.6.2
X R403.6.3
X R403.7
X R403.8
X R403.9
X R403.10
X R403.10.1
X R403.10.2
X R403.10.3
X R403.11
X R403.12
X R404.1
X R404.1.1
X R404.1.2
X R404.2



X R404.3
X R405.1
X R405.2
X TABLE R405.2
X Deleted R405.3
X R405.3.2
X R405.3.2.1
X R405.3.2.2
X Deleted R405.4.3.
X TABLE R405.4.2(1)

X X R406.1.1
X Deleted R406.2
X R406.2
X TABLE R406.2
X R406.3

X X R406.3(1)
X R406.3.1
X R406.3.2
X R406.4
X R406.5
X TABLE R406.5
X R406.6

X X R406.6.4
X X R406.6.5
X X R406.7(1-3)

X R406.7.2
X R406.7.2.1
X R406.7.2.2
X R406.7.3
X R407.1
X R407.2

X X R408.1
X X R408.2
X X R408.2.1
X X R408.2.2
X X R408.2.3
X X R408.2.4

R408.2.5

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X R501.1
X R501.1.1
X R501.2
X R502.1
X R502.2

CHAPTER R5 EXISTING BUILDINGS



X R502.3.1
X R502.3.2
X R503.1
X R503.1.2
X R505.1
X R505.1.1



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 101.3
X 103.1
X 103.3

X X 108.2
X X 108.3
X X 108.4
X X 108.5

X 109.2
X 109.3
X 111.1

X X 111.2

[A] 111.2 Limitations on authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim 
that the true intent of this code or the rules legally adopted thereunder have been 
incorrectly interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply, or an equivalent or 
better form of construction is proposed. The board shall not have authority to waive 
requirements of this code or interpret the administration of this code. The application 
shall be filed on a form obtained from the code official within 20 days after the notice was 
served.

X 111.3
X 111.4
X 114.1
X 114.2
X 114.3
X 114.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X CHEMICAL STORAGE SPACE
X COPPER ALLOY
X EQUIPMENT ROOM
X INDOOR AQUATIC FACILITY
X INTERACTIVE WATER PLAY FEATURES
X SWIMOUT
X UNDERWATER BENCH

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 305.1.1
X 305.2.4.1
X 305.2.9
X 305.3
X 305.3.1
X 305.3.2

2021 ISPSC
CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS

CHAPTER 3 GENERAL COMPLIANCE



X 305.3.3
X 305.3.4
X 305.4
X 305.8

X X 307.1.2.1

307.1.2.1 Munsell color value. Finishes shall be not less than 6.5 on the Munsell color 
value scale.  Exceptions: The following shall not be required to comply with this section:  
1. Competitive lane markings.  2. Floors of dedicated competitive diving wells.  3. Step or 
bench edge markings.  4. Pools shallower than 24 inches (609.6 mm).  5. Water line tiles.  
6. Wave and surf pool depth change indicator tiles.  7. Depth change indicator tiles where 
a rope and float line is provided.  8. Features such as rock formations, as approved.  9. 
Private residential pools.

X X 307.1.4

307.1.4 Accessibility. An accessible route to public pools and spas shall be provided in 
accordance with the International Building Code. Accessibility within public pools and 
spas shall be provided as required by the accessible recreational facilities provisions of 
the International Building Code. Pool and spa lifts providing an accessible means of entry 
into the water shall be listed and labeled in accordance with UL 60335-2-1000 and be 
installed in accordance with ICC A117.1-09 and NFPA 70.

X 307.2.4
X 311.3
X 311.3.1
X 311.3.2
X 316.2
X 316.4
X 316.6
X 316.6.2
X 316.6.3
X Table 316.2 (1)
X Table 316.2 (2)
X 317.1
X 321.2.3
X 322.3.1
X 324.1
X 324.2
X 324.3
X 324.4
X 324.5
X 324.6
X 324.7
X 324.7.1
X 324.7.2
X 324.7.2.1
X 324.8
X 324.8.1



X 324.8.1.1
X 324.8.2
X 324.8.2.1
X 324.8.2.2
X 324.8.2.3
X 324.9
X 324.9.1
X 324.1
X 324.11
X 324.12
X 325.1

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 407.3
X 407.3.1
X 407.3.2
X 407.4
X 407.4.1
X 407.4.2
X 407.4.3
X 407.4.4
X 411.2.5
X 411.3.3

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 504.2

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 609.1
X 609.2
X 609.2.1
X 609.2.2
X 609.3
X 609.3.1
X Deleted 609.3.2
X 609.3.3
X Deleted 609.3.4
X Deleted 609.3.5
X 609.4.1
X 609.7
X 610.7.1
X 610.7.2
X 612.1
X 612.2
X 612.3

CHAPTER 5 PUBLIC SPAS AND PUBLIC EXERCISE SPAS

CHAPTER 4 PUBLIC SWIMMING POOLS

CHAPTER 6 AQUATIC RECREATION FACILITIES



X 612.4
X 612.4.1
X 612.4.2
X 612.4.3
X 612.4.4
X 612.5
X 612.5.1
X 612.5.2
X 612.5.3
X 612.5.4
X 612.5.5
X 612.6
X 612.7

CHAPTER 7 ONGROUND STORABLE RESIDENTIAL SWIMMING POOLS, No Changes
CHAPTER 8 PERMANENT INGROUND RESIDENTIAL SWIMMING POOLS, No Changes
CHAPTER 9 PERMANENT RESIDENTIAL SPAS AND PERMANENT RESIDENTIAL EXERCISE SPAS, No Changes
CHAPTER 10 PORTABLE RESIDENTIAL SPAS AND PORTABLE RESIDENTIAL EXERCISE SPAS, No Changes



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 101.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 501.3.4
X 501.3.5

2021 ICCPC

CHAPTER 7 PEDESTRIAN CIRCULATION No Change
CHAPTER 8 SAFETY OF USERS No Change

CHAPTER 22 HAZARDOUS MATERIALS No Change
CHAPTER 21 EMERGENCY RESPONDER SAFETY No Change
CHAPTER 20 EMERGENCY NOTIFICATION, ACCESS AND FACILITIES No Change

CHAPTER 9 MOISTURE No Change
CHAPTER 10 INTERIOR ENVIRONMENT No Change
CHAPTER 11 MECHANICAL No Change
CHAPTER 12 PLUMBING No Change

CHAPTER 19 MEANS OF EGRESS No Change
CHAPTER 18 MANAGEMENT OF PEOPLE No Change

CHAPTER 14 ELECTRICITY No Change
CHAPTER 13 FUEL GAS No Change

CHAPTER 15 ENERGY EFFICIENCY No Change
CHAPTER 16 FIRE PREVENTION No Change
CHAPTER 17 FIRE IMPACT MANAGEMENT No Change

CHAPTER 6 FIRE SAFETY No Change

CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS No Changes
CHAPTER 3 DESIGN PERFORMANCE LEVELS No Changes
CHAPTER 4 RELIABILITY AND DURABILITY No Changes
CHAPTER 5 STABILITY No Change



Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 101.3
X 103.1
X 103.3
X 107.1
X 109.1
X 109.2
X 109.3
X 112.1
X 112.2
X 113.1
X 113.2
X 113.3
X 113.4
X 114.1
X 114.2
X 114.4

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X ROOF ASSEMBLY
X ROOF COVERING
X ROOF COVERING SYSTEM
X ROOF DECK

Controversial Adopt Modify Do Not Adopt Section Modified Language 
X 504.2
X 504.7
X 505.2
X 505.7
X 506.2

2021 IWUIC
CHAPTER 1 SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

CHAPTER 6 FIRE PROTECTION REQUIREMENTS, No Changes

CHAPTER 5 SPECIAL BUILDING CONSTRUCTION REGULATIONS

CHAPTER 3 WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE AREAS, No Changes

CHAPTER 2 DEFINITIONS

CHAPTER 4 WILDLAND-URBAN INTERFACE AREA REQUIREMENTS, No Changes


	IBC
	IBC_CH9
	IEBC
	IRC
	IRC_EN
	IRC_M
	IRC_P_FG
	IFC
	IFC_CH10
	IMC
	IPC
	IFGC
	IECC
	ISPSC
	ICCPC
	IWUIC

